

Contracted Services – Fine Arts - RFP #20-0630-19
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2025

VENDOR	CONTACT PERSON	CONTACT EMAIL	SERVICES PROVIDED
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	Kelly Gonzalez	kelly@artandkustomkreations.com	<p>On and off-site enrichment art classes to students in elementary through high school. 1-hour interactive instructor led class, children are provided with all supplies necessary to create their own project masterpieces on a weekly basis. Flexible scheduling for classes before, during, or after school hours. Online options are also available. Throughout the semester, students are introduced to new artists, design styles, and techniques. Our projects incorporate a variety of media and materials such as drawing, painting, sculpture, and multimedia. Each of AKK's lesson plans are accompanied by a chart outlining the lesson's alignment with TEKS, which in turn, aligns with curriculum.</p>

Contracted Services – Fine Arts - RFP #20-0630-19
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2025

VENDOR	CONTACT PERSON	CONTACT EMAIL	SERVICES PROVIDED
Batt Audio, Video & Lighting	Mark Batts	sales@battsavl.com	Sales, service and consultation for professional audio, video, lighting, rigging, drapes, projections systems, and theatrical consumables.
Brook Mays and H&H Music (Universal Melody Services	Mickey Hartzog	mhartzog@brookmays.com	Musical supplies and equipment, repair and services of musical instruments and instrument rentals
Cole Williams	Cole Williams	cole@cmwpercussion.com	Percussion arranger for marching band
Expressions Productions	Theodesia Drummer	expressionsproductionsco@gmail.com	Performing and Cultural Art Residencies; Cultural Art job related opportunities/stipends; Family and Community Engagement; Lectures; Master Classes/Workshops; Docent (Performing Arts) training for area schools/teachers and community organizations; Professional Development training in the areas of Performing Arts, Cultural enrichment; Creative recreation.

**Contracted Services – Fine Arts - RFP #20-0630-19
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2025**

VENDOR	CONTACT PERSON	CONTACT EMAIL	SERVICES PROVIDED
Frederick Patrick	Fred Patrick	freddy.c.patrick@gmail.com	Contest Judging, Masterclass Clinician, Audio Technology Set Up and Troubleshooting
Gregory W. Dick	Gregory W. Dick	gwdick@comcast.net	I am a band consultant for grades 6-12. My services include helping directors with their band classes progress in performance and music selection. I also can do sectionals and master classes and assist with the progress of the beginning band student/class. I can also help the marching band with rehearsals both indoors and outdoors. I can serve as a judge for solo/ensemble as well as Pre-UIL events. All aspects of program development. I have taught band in public schools for 41 years. I have judged all types of UIL events.
Hunter Dorman	Hunter Dorman	dorman_hunter@yahoo.com	Summer masterclass instruction for middle and high school band students.
Karen Skaggs	Karen Skaggs	karen.e.skaggs@gmail.com	5th grade instrument interviews

**Contracted Services – Fine Arts - RFP #20-0630-19
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2025**

VENDOR	CONTACT PERSON	CONTACT EMAIL	SERVICES PROVIDED
Kenneth Cox	Kenneth Cox	Coxkj2@gmail.com	Masterclass Teaching (Flute), Private Lessons (Flute), Music Consultant, UIL Judging
Logan Nagai	Logan Nagai	logan.nagai@fortbendisd.com	A judge for Solo and Ensemble Contest
Matthew Hogan	James Matthew Hogan	matt.hogan08@gmail.com	Marching band technician; Will work with marching band to aid with visual and musical development
Mighty Music Publishing (Mollie Gregory Tower, LLC)	Mollie Tower	mightymusic.Mollie@gmail.com	Music Memory teaching materials to support the UIL Music Memory Contest
QuaverMusic.com, LLC	Carlie Phillips	CarliePhillips@quaverEd.com	Our comprehensive, customizable, and fully digital program for Grades PreK-8 General Music includes: 1) thirty-six (36) weeks of lessons aligned to TEKS including interactive teacher-led presentations, corresponding teacher notes, and accompanying printable materials in a digital format PLUS additional Song-Based Lessons 2)Quaver Essentials and ClassPlay supplemental resources and 3) teacher administration tools for assessment, grading, and reporting.

Contracted Services – Fine Arts - RFP #20-0630-19
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2025

VENDOR	CONTACT PERSON	CONTACT EMAIL	SERVICES PROVIDED
Reynaldo Chapa, Jr	Reynaldo Chapa, Jr	rchapajr08@gmail.com	Percussion Instruction in the concert and marching band setting
Shaina Goodson	Shaina Goodson	shainad44@gmail.com	Private Trumpet Lessons & Master Classes
Soundstripe, Inc	Christine Phares	christine@yahouston.org	Unlimited, royalty free music and sound effects for creators.
Trevor Braselton	Trevor Braselton	tbraselton@dickinsonisd.org	Solo and Ensemble Adjudicator and clinician.
Tyler Martin	Tyler Martin	Tcmhr608@gmail.com	Facilitating 5 Masterclasses, each 2hrs, to the band students
Unit Sets Unlimited (Unit Sets, LLC)	Darbi Tidwell	unitsetsunlimited@gmail.com	UIL One Act Play unit sets

1	If you are to be paid PER HOUR, please give your HOURLY RATE. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Hour. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed).			Scope of work	Minimum Hours	Rate Range
Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Describe the service(s) that apply to this hourly rate.	If you will bill a minimum number of hours, please indicate the minimum number of hours you would bill the Department here:	Please specify here the range of pricing	
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid					
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting	\$125.00		Any repair or service call	2	\$125-\$250/hour, PLUS TRAVEL (\$1 per mile, ROUND TRIP)	
Brook Mays and H&H Music (Universal Melody Services)	No Bid					

			Provides on- site Fine Arts instruction or services (Fine Arts) 1 hr. basis 25 X1 ratio. Including but not limited to: <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • Performing and Cultural Art Residencies. • Cultural Art job related opportunities/stipends • Family and Community Engagement • Lectures • Master Classes/Workshops • Docent (Performing Arts) training for area schools/teachers and community • Organizations. • Professional Development training in the areas of Performing Arts, Cultural enrichment • and Creative recreation. 		
Expressions Productions	\$100.00			1	\$100.00 per hr. includes one sessions 45 min.
Frederick Patrick	\$75.00		Instrumental Judging, Masterclass Teaching, Audio Troubleshooting	2	Depending on the length of the job and complexity required will determine final pricing between \$60-75
Gregory W. Dick	\$125.00		Band consultant, grades 6-12	1	
QuaverMusic.com, LLC	No Bid				
Reynaldo Chapa Jr.	\$50.00		Percussion Instructor	2	\$46.00-\$50.00
Shaina Goodson	\$50.00		Private Trumpet Lessons & Master Classes	2	

2	If you are to be paid PER DAY, please give your DAILY RATE.			Scope of work	Rate Range
Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Describe the service(s) that apply to this daily rate.	Please specify here the range of pricing:	
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid				
Brook Mays and H&H Music (Universal Melody Services)	No Bid				
Expressions Productions	\$400.00		Provides on- site Fine Arts instruction or services (Fine Arts) 5 to 8 hr. basis 25 X1 ratio. Including but not limited to: <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • Performing and Cultural Art Residencies. • Cultural Art job related opportunities/stipends • Family and Community Engagement • Lectures • Master Classes/Workshops • Docent (Performing Arts) training for area schools/teachers and community • Organizations. • Professional Development training in the areas of Performing Arts, Cultural enrichment • and Creative recreation. 	\$400.00 @ 5 to 8 hr activity. . 25 X ratio, multiple sessions	
Mighty Music Publishing (Mollie Gregory Tower, LLC)	\$500.00				

3	If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please give your PER EVENT RATE (Examples of this type of service may include, but not be limited to: speaker at In-service trainings, professional development events).			Scope of work	Rate Range
Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Describe the service(s) that apply to this event rate.	Please specify here the range of pricing:	
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid				
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting	No Bid				
Brook Mays and H&H Music (Universal Melody Services)	No Bid				
Expressions Productions	\$500.00		Provides on- site Fine Arts instruction or services (Fine Arts) 1 to 3 hr per diem. Including but not limited to: <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • Performing and Cultural Art Residencies. • Cultural Art job related opportunities/stipends • Family and Community Engagement • Lectures • Master Classes/Workshops • Docent (Performing Arts) training for area schools/teachers and community • Organizations. • Professional Development training in the areas of Performing Arts, Cultural enrichment and Creative recreation. 	\$500.00 @ 1 to 3 workshop/event @ 25 X ratio, multiple sessions	
Soundstripe Inc.	\$795.00		Unlimited, royalty free music and sound effects for creators.	\$795 per year billed annually	

4	If you are to be paid LUMP SUM, please give your rate.			Scope of work	Rate Range
Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Describe the service(s) that apply to this LUMP SUM rate.	Please specify here the range of pricing:	
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid				
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting	No Bid				
Brook Mays and H&H Music (Universal Melody Services)	No Bid				
Cole Williams	\$2,500.00		Percussion Arranger	\$2500	
Expressions Productions	\$19,000.00		<p>Provides on- site Fine Arts instruction or services (Fine Arts) 1 to 8 hrs. per diem. Including but not limited to:</p> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • Performing and Cultural Art Residencies. • Cultural Art job related opportunities/stipends • Family and Community Engagement • Lectures • Master Classes/Workshops • Docent (Performing Arts) training for area schools/teachers and community • Organizations. • Professional Development training in the areas of Performing Arts, Cultural enrichment and Creative recreation. 	<p>Basic Fees include 5 days- 2 hrs. sessions: Option 1: Full Yearly term of \$19,000 @ 10% Discount; Hourly rate of \$ 100.00 @ 1 hrs. over approximately the contracting period from AUGUST to MAY, including summer months from May to August [Excluding Holidays].</p>	

Hunter Dorman	\$800.00		Masterclasses given to middle and high school students for a week of summer band.	
Tyler Martin	\$700.00		Facilitating 5 Masterclasses, each 2hrs, to the band students	\$140/class

5 If you are to be paid PER PARTICIPANT, please give your RATE PER PARTICIPANT.

Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Scope of work Describe the service(s) that apply to per participant rate.	Rate Range Please specify here the range of pricing:
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	\$117.00	We offer two payment options: parent pay and school/district pay. (The rate provided in the per participant field is for a 12 week session. See NOTE below for additional information.)Our "each" pricing is based on 12 weeks for the fall semester and 14 weeks for a spring semester. Should the contract begin mid-semester, a prorated option will be available by simply dividing the participant number by the number of weeks the class will actually take place. There are no hidden fees. We offer two pricing options with discounts built into the type of payment choice: individual schools and group rate of 10 or more schools.NOTE: Please see Price Proposal Overview with chart including school/district discounts in the "Response Attachments" Tab for further explanation regarding pricing.	Classes are semester based and run for 1-hour each week at a mutually agreed upon time and location for 12 or 14 weeks depending on the season. Our art enrichment class lessons guide students through foundations and extensions of the principles and elements of art by incorporating a variety of media such as drawing, painting, sculpture, and multimedia.	\$108-\$136.50
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting	No Bid			
Brook Mays and H&H Music (Universal Melody Services)	No Bid			
Expressions Productions	No Bid			

QuaverMusic.com, LLC	\$280.00		Our comprehensive, customizable, and fully digital program for Grades PreK-8 General Music includes: 1) thirty-six (36) weeks of lessons aligned to TEKS including interactive teacher-led presentations, corresponding teacher notes, and accompanying printable materials in a digital format PLUS additional Song-Based Lessons 2)Quaver Essentials and ClassPlay supplemental resources and 3) teacher administration tools for assessment, grading, and reporting.	\$280/per grade, per year
----------------------	----------	--	---	---------------------------

6 Percent discount on any materials you would sell in support of the services to be offered with this solicitation.		
Supplier	% Discount	Supplier Notes
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid	
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting	No Bid	
Brook Mays and H&H Music (Universal Melody Services)	0.0%	Internet & Catalog prices are already discounted, all bids receive free freight.
Expressions Productions	10.0%	Basic Fees include 1 day- 2hrs sessions: Option1: Full Yearly term of \$19,000 @ 10% Discount; Hourly rate of \$ 100.00 @ 1 hrs. over approximately the contracting period from AUGUST to MAY, including summer months from May to August [Excluding Holidays].
Reynaldo Chapa Jr.	0.0%	
Unit Sets Unlimited (Unit Sets, LLC)	0.0%	We don't have a discount except on multiple set orders, but we do offer free shipping for all complete set orders.