

District-Wide Contracted Services
RFP # #20-0630-18
Contract Expiration Date – June 30, 2025
Approved Vendors

Aquilla Educational Resources, LLC
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)
Behavior Plus, Inc
C1 Fiber, LLC (Jefferey W. Harris)
Campus Adventures, LLC (CA Community Services)
Conscious Education Consulting, LLC
Eduphoria!, Inc
Engage! Learning, Inc dba Engage2Learn
Karen Gibson
KinderLab Robotics, Inc
Learning Rocks! Educational Group (Gretchen Childs)
Lectura Books dba The Latino Family Literacy Project (Lectura, Inc)
Lone Star Oil Recovery
Megan A. Mooney, Ph.D. PLLC
MYS Iniativves, LLC
Paulson Photography, LLC
Powell, Youngblood & Taylor, LLP
Sava Learning Company, LLC (Gateway Educational Holdings, LLC)
ShowMakers of America (Visel Enterprises)
STEM Revolution, LLC
Teachstone, Inc
Texas Seat Covers, Inc
Think Big Learning
Tiffany Cox
TouchMath Acquisitions, LLC
Troxell Communications, Inc
University Instructors
Visual Services of Texas (VST Visual of Texas)

1	If you are to be paid PER HOUR, please give your HOURLY RATE. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Hour.). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID".			Minimum Hours	Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	If you will bill a minimum number of hours, please indicate the minimum number of hours you would bill the Department here:	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Aquilla Educational Resources (Aquilla Educational Resources, LLC)	\$100.00	Hourly Rate is for Consulting Services Only. Charges may include travel if over 100 mile radius from zip code 75126.	1	No Range
	Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid			
	Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid			
	C1 Fiber, LLC (Jeffrey W. Harris)	\$114.75	This represents a 15% discount from the current hourly rate of \$135/hour.	Hours billed are actual time spent tracked in minutes, there is no minimum.	
	Campus Adventures, LLC (C.A. Community Services)	No Bid			
	Conscious Education Consulting, LLC.	\$450.00		1 hr	
	Eduphoria! Inc.	\$200.00	These are for web consultation or web training only.		
	Engage! Learning, Inc. dba engage2learn	No Bid			
	Karen Gibson, Independent Consultant	No Bid			
	KinderLab Robotics, Inc	No Bid			
	Learning Rocks! Educational Group (Gretchen Childs)	No Bid			

Lectura Books, DBA The Latino Family Literacy Project (Lectura, Inc.)	No Bid			
Lone Star Oil Recovery (Eric P Chapa DBA Lone Star Oil Recovery)	No Bid			
Megan A. Mooney, Ph.D. PLLC	\$250.00		1	
MYS Initiatives, LLC	No Bid			
Paulson Photography, LLC	\$75.00	Pricing per hour is used for attending professional photography during events or for corporate professional head shots as used in the past with Board Members group portrait.	2	1-8 hours
Powell, Youngblood & Taylor, LLP	\$285.00		We do not bill for a minimum number of hours.	Powell, Youngblood & Taylor attorneys maintain daily time records in 1/10 hour increments. Our pricing ranges goes from \$100-285 per hour depending on who's services are requested. For more information, please see our Fees & Expenses PDF uploaded to the Response Attachments Tab.
Savvas Learning Company LLC (Gateway Education Holdings LLC)	No Bid			
ShowMakers of America (Visel Enterprises)	No Bid			

STEM Revolution LLC	No Bid			
Teachstone Inc.	No Bid			
Texas Seat Covers, Inc	No Bid			
Think Big Learning	No Bid			
Tiffany Cox	\$25.00		5	
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid			
Troxell Communications, Inc.	No Bid			
University Instructors	No Bid	Please see PRICE PROPOSAL		
Visual Services of Texas (VST Visual of Texas)	No Bid			

2	If you are to be paid PER DAY, please give your DAILY RATE. If your services are not billed per day please click on "NO BID" . (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Day)			Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Aquilla Educational Resources (Aquilla Educational Resources, LLC)	No Bid		
	Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid		
	Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid		
	C1 Fiber, LLC (Jeffrey W. Harris)	No Bid		
	Campus Adventures, LLC (C.A. Community Services)	No Bid		
	Conscious Education Consulting, LLC.	\$2,500.00		
	Eduphoria! Inc.	\$2,300.00	This is the rate for Onsite Training.	
	Engage! Learning, Inc. dba engage2learn	\$4,300.00	Please see attached fee schedule.	\$1,800-\$4,300 per day
	Karen Gibson, Independent Consultant	\$1,400.00		
	KinderLab Robotics, Inc	No Bid		

Learning Rocks! Educational Group (Gretchen Childs)	\$1,300.00		3 hour training - 650.00, 5 hour training - 1000.00
Lectura Books, DBA The Latino Family Literacy Project (Lectura, Inc.)	No Bid		
Lone Star Oil Recovery (Eric P Chapa DBA Lone Star Oil Recovery)	No Bid		
Megan A. Mooney, Ph.D. PLLC	No Bid		
MYS Initiatives, LLC	No Bid		
Paulson Photography, LLC	No Bid		
Powell, Youngblood & Taylor, LLP	No Bid		
Savvas Learning Company LLC (Gateway Education Holdings LLC)	\$1.00	Pricing is outlined on page 48 of the response.	
ShowMakers of America (Visel Enterprises)	No Bid		
STEM Revolution LLC	\$4,500.00	Full cost proposal for various options and workshops provided as an attachment. Rate does not include travel on the line item cost. Rate also is per trainer. Multiple trainers are typically needed depending on number of attendees	
Teachstone Inc.	No Bid		
Texas Seat Covers, Inc	No Bid		

			Our range per day is \$2,750 to \$3,500. Our standard rate is \$3,000 per day for up to 50 participants. For some trainings, however, we allow additional participants for a higher fee. We also offer a \$250 discount for each consecutive day booked.
Think Big Learning	\$3,500.00		
Tiffany Cox	\$250.00	250.00-750.00	price range includes material/course prep
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid		
Troxell Communications, Inc.	No Bid		
University Instructors	No Bid	Please see PRICE PROPOSAL	
Visual Services of Texas (VST Visual of Texas)	No Bid		

3	If you are to be paid PER PARTICIPANT, please give your RATE PER PARTICIPANT. If your services are not billed per participant please click on "NO BID".(Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services.)			
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Rate Range
				Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Aquilla Educational Resources (Aquilla Educational Resources, LLC)	No Bid		
	Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid		
Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid			

C1 Fiber, LLC (Jeffrey W. Harris)	No Bid		
Campus Adventures, LLC (C.A. Community Services)	\$40.00	Please see a price break down in Exhibit "B" in attachments	\$40.00 per week per full time student. \$160 per month per full time student. See pricing sheet for part time rates
Conscious Education Consulting, LLC.	No Bid		
Eduphoria! Inc.	No Bid		
Engage! Learning, Inc. dba engage2learn	No Bid		
Karen Gibson, Independent Consultant	No Bid		
KinderLab Robotics, Inc	No Bid		
Learning Rocks! Educational Group (Gretchen Childs)	No Bid		
Lectura Books, DBA The Latino Family Literacy Project (Lectura, Inc.)	\$250.00	For a minimum of 15 trainees and 3 campuses, we offer a half day in-person workshop at your location for \$250 per person. This cost includes a curriculum binder for each person, access to our downloadable program support forms and templates, and ongoing e-support during implementation of our programs. Online video webinar training is also available at \$200 per person, which includes a curriculum binder that is sent to the trainee for reference during the webinar. FREE webinar training for 2 people is included with purchase of our program materials in our All-Inclusive Offers. Please see https://www.latinoliteracy.com/webinar-special-all-inclusive/ for further details.	
Lone Star Oil Recovery (Eric P Chapa DBA Lone Star Oil Recovery)	No Bid		

Megan A. Mooney, Ph.D. PLLC	No Bid		
MYS Initiatives, LLC	\$40.00		
Paulson Photography, LLC	\$15.00	This pricing is based picture packages ranging from the smallest to the largest picture package.	\$15-150
Powell, Youngblood & Taylor, LLP	No Bid		
Savvas Learning Company LLC (Gateway Education Holdings LLC)	\$1.00	Pricing is outlined on page 48 of the response.	
ShowMakers of America (Visel Enterprises)	\$500.00		Depends upon camp chosen \$150-\$500
STEM Revolution LLC	No Bid	Attached a cost /pricing proposal for workshops based on number needed	
Teachstone Inc.	No Bid		
Texas Seat Covers, Inc	No Bid		
Think Big Learning	No Bid		
Tiffany Cox	No Bid		
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid		
Troxell Communications, Inc.	No Bid		
University Instructors	No Bid	Please see PRICE PROPOSAL	
Visual Services of Texas (VST Visual of Texas)	No Bid		

4	If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please give your PER EVENT RATE (Examples of this type of service may include, but not be limited to: speaker at In-service trainings, professional development events, session, etc.). If your services are not billed per Event please click on "NO BID" . (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services.)			Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Aquilla Educational Resources (Aquilla Educational Resources, LLC)	\$1,000.00	Per Event Rate is for a 4-hour Workshop. Multiple Events may be contracted per day.	2-hour Workshops \$500.00, Standard 4-hour Workshops \$1000.00

Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid		
Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid		
C1 Fiber, LLC (Jeffrey W. Harris)	No Bid		
Campus Adventures, LLC (C.A. Community Services)	No Bid		
Conscious Education Consulting, LLC.	\$850.00		\$850-\$2500 based on the number of hours at an event. If only one hour \$850, if 4 hours \$1250, if full day \$2500.
Eduphoria! Inc.	No Bid		
Engage! Learning, Inc. dba engage2learn	No Bid		
Karen Gibson, Independent Consultant	No Bid		
KinderLab Robotics, Inc	No Bid		
Learning Rocks! Educational Group (Gretchen Childs)	No Bid		
Lectura Books, DBA The Latino Family Literacy Project (Lectura, Inc.)	No Bid		
Lone Star Oil Recovery (Eric P Chapa DBA Lone Star Oil Recovery)	No Bid		
Megan A. Mooney, Ph.D. PLLC	No Bid		
MYS Initiatives, LLC	\$5,000.00		
Paulson Photography, LLC	No Bid		
Powell, Youngblood & Taylor, LLP	No Bid		
Savvas Learning Company LLC (Gateway Education Holdings LLC)	No Bid		

ShowMakers of America (Visel Enterprises)	\$8,000.00		Depends upon number and type of routines-can range from \$110-\$400 per routine. Above is an estimate of team, officer, and solo routines.
STEM Revolution LLC	\$4,500.00	attached a pricing proposal. Rate does not include travel on the line item cost. Rate also is per trainer. Multiple trainers are typically needed depending on number of attendees	
Teachstone Inc.	No Bid	Please see the attached pricing sheet for a comprehensive list of our in person and virtual trainings.	
Texas Seat Covers,Inc	No Bid		
Think Big Learning	No Bid		
Tiffany Cox	\$300.00		
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	\$4,000.00		Please see our TouchMath University Catalog for a full listing of trainings and pricing. Price listed is for in-person training. Virtual training is \$1250.

			Rate Range \$ 2495.00 to \$ 7,995.00 per event, based on Attached Budget Sheet Descriptions. Customized options available.
Troxell Communications, Inc.	\$7,995.00		
University Instructors	No Bid		
Visual Services of Texas (VST Visual of Texas)	No Bid		

5	If you are to be paid LUMP SUM, please give your rate. If your services are not billed per LUMP SUM please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Line Items" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services.)			Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Aquilla Educational Resources (Aquilla Educational Resources, LLC)	No Bid		
	Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	No Bid		
	Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid		
	C1 Fiber, LLC (Jeffrey W. Harris)	No Bid		
	Campus Adventures, LLC (C.A. Community Services)	No Bid	We are a non profit and able to receive district awarded grant money. We can tailor our fees to align with your grant.	
	Conscious Education Consulting, LLC.	\$7,500.00		If booked for an entire school for various services, this is the rate for the year.
	Eduphoria! Inc.	No Bid		
	Engage! Learning, Inc. dba engage2learn	No Bid		

Karen Gibson, Independent Consultant	No Bid		
KinderLab Robotics, Inc	No Bid		
Learning Rocks! Educational Group (Gretchen Childs)	No Bid		
Lectura Books, DBA The Latino Family Literacy Project (Lectura, Inc.)	No Bid		
Lone Star Oil Recovery (Eric P Chapa DBA Lone Star Oil Recovery)	No Bid		
Megan A. Mooney, Ph.D. PLLC	No Bid		
MYS Initiatives, LLC	No Bid		
Paulson Photography, LLC	No Bid		
Powell, Youngblood & Taylor, LLP	No Bid		
Savvas Learning Company LLC (Gateway Education Holdings LLC)	\$1.00	Pricing is outlined on page 48 of the response.	
ShowMakers of America (Visel Enterprises)	\$1,600.00		Depends upon virtual camp purchased. 1000-1600
STEM Revolution LLC	No Bid	attached a pricing proposal	
Teachstone Inc.	No Bid		
Texas Seat Covers, Inc	No Bid		
Think Big Learning	No Bid		
Tiffany Cox	No Bid		
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid		
Troxell Communications, Inc.	No Bid		
University Instructors	No Bid	Please see PRICE PROPOSAL	

Visual Services of Texas (VST Visual of Texas)	\$35.00		Our Banner prices and services vary depending on material , size and # of graphic artists time
---	---------	--	--

6	If you are to be paid PER SITE (LOCATION), please give your rate. If your services are not billed PER SITE please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Line Items" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services.)			
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Rate Range
				Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Aquilla Educational Resources (Aquilla Educational Resources, LLC)	No Bid		
	Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	\$20.00	Project pricing varies depending on the Scope of Work. Please see "Response Attachments" tab for additional information.	\$5-\$20 per sq. ft. depending on the overall scope of work - see "Response Attachments" tab for additional information
	Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid		
	C1 Fiber, LLC (Jeffrey W. Harris)	No Bid		
	Campus Adventures, LLC (C.A. Community Services)	No Bid		

Conscious Education Consulting, LLC.	\$2,500.00		The total range per site is \$450-\$7500. If booked to do multiple events at different sites, the same prices apply, per site. For example, one hour is \$450 per site; 4 hours is \$1250 per site; one day is \$2500 per site; and one year is \$7500 per cite.
Eduphoria! Inc.	No Bid		
Engage! Learning, Inc. dba engage2learn	No Bid		
Karen Gibson, Independendent Consultant	No Bid		
KinderLab Robotics, Inc	No Bid		
Learning Rocks! Educational Group (Gretchen Childs)	No Bid		
Lectura Books, DBA The Latino Family Literacy Project (Lectura, Inc.)	No Bid		
Lone Star Oil Recovery (Eric P Chapa DBA Lone Star Oil Recovery)	No Bid		
Megan A. Mooney, Ph.D. PLLC	No Bid		
MYS Initiattivves, LLC	No Bid		
Paulson Photography, LLC	No Bid		
Powell, Youngblood & Taylor, LLP	No Bid		
Savvas Learning Company LLC (Gateway Education Holdings LLC)	\$1.00	Pricing is outlined on page 48 of the response.	

ShowMakers of America (Visel Enterprises)	No Bid		
STEM Revolution LLC	No Bid	Attached pricing proposal	
Teachstone Inc.	No Bid		
Texas Seat Covers, Inc	No Bid		
Think Big Learning	No Bid		
Tiffany Cox	No Bid		
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid		
Troxell Communications, Inc.	No Bid		
University Instructors	No Bid	Please see PRICE PROPOSAL	
Visual Services of Texas (VST Visual of Texas)	No Bid		