

**Health and Athletic Supplies**  
**RFP # #20-0630-23**  
Contract Expiration Date – June 30, 2025  
**Approved Vendors**

Action Wear Plus  
ADDI, LLC  
ALERT SERVICES INC  
Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supply, LLC  
Bill Fritz Sports Corp  
Bio Corporation  
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc)  
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)  
DANZGEAR  
DJO Global, Inc  
Educational Products, Inc  
Getpoms.com  
Golf Team Products  
Got Ya Covered  
Graphics Store  
HALO Branded Solutions, Inc  
IRC Team Sports (Indianapolis Racquet Club, Inc)  
Knockout Sportswear  
Korney Board Aids  
Koza's Inc  
Leapin Leotards  
Leonetti Graphics, Inc  
Logomatic  
Maxi Aids  
Medco Supply Company (Performance Health Supply)  
Medicaleshop, Inc  
MFAC, LLC (M-F Athletic/ Perform Better)  
Midway PSG dba Pasadena Sporting Goods  
Promaxima  
PWI Investment Group, Inc  
Rebel Athletics, Inc  
Riddell (All American Sports Corp)  
S&S Worldwide  
SAS Distribution  
School Health Corp  
School Nurse Supply, Inc  
School Specialty, Inc

Southern Athletic Supply  
Sparkle  
Speed Stacks, Inc.  
Sports Imports  
Swim Shop of the Southwest (Adolf Kiefer & Associates)  
Team Go Figure (Single Price Apparel)  
Tennis Express  
Tennis Outlet, Inc  
Texas Motion Sports  
Texas Swim Shop (Matheme, Inc)  
The Costume Closet  
The Sensory Kids Store  
Troxell Communications, Inc  
T-Shirt Trends  
US Games (Varsity Brands Holding Co, Inc dba BSN Sports)  
Varsity Spirit Fashion (Varsity Brands Holding Co, Inc)  
William V. MacGill & Co  
Wisstech Enterprise (William Wissen)

1	Percentage Discount		
Supplier	% Discount	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	
Action Wear Plus	15.0%		
ADDI LLC	5.0%		
ALERT SERVICES INC	20.0%	Discounts are up to 20%, there are items exempt from discount. See attached letter on discounts	
Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	5.0%		
BILL FRITZ SPORTS CORP.	10.0%		
Bio Corporation	5.0%	5% off current catalog	
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	10.0%	BSN Sports 10% off current price with exceptions see attached / 35% off catalog price all Nike, UA, New Balance, Asics apparel and 30% off footwear Nike and Under Armour. from bSN Sports Teamwear Catalog. contact Lance Botkin 832-372-0392 lbotkin@bsnsports.com for all apparel and footwear.	
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)	10.0%	We will offer 15% off uniforms and warm ups, 10% off all other apparel and accessories. No additional discounts on clearance/closeout items. Other promotions may apply.	
DANZGEAR	0.0%	OUR CATALOG IS ALREADY DISCOUNTED FOR SCHOOLS AND GROUPS.	
DJO Global, Inc	21.0%	21% off of Donjoy and Procure items, 20% off of Aircast	
Educational Products, Inc	5.0%	Discounts do not apply to apparel flyer pricing and any other promotional campaigns	
getpoms.com	0.0%	0-10%	
Golf Team Products	0.0%		
Got Ya Covered	0.0%	Discount is built into bid, difficult to make a flat discount not knowing the quantity etc.	
Graphics Store	5.0%	Graphics Store provide customer apparel through embroidery and screen printing – hats, t-shirts, sweatshirts/pants, bags and various promotional items. Discounts ranges from 5-20%, based on the quantity ordered. We also offer the Shirt Angel program for schools/non-profits. Receive 3 free shirts for every 30 shirts your order of the same design. This applies to garment style 5000, youth small – adult extra large.	
HALO Branded Solutions, Inc.	5.0%		
IRC TEAM SPORTS (INDIANAPOLIS RACQUET CLUB, INC.)	30.0%	We offer up to 30% off of MSRP on apparel. Team discounts on tennis balls and court equipment.	
Knockout Sportswear (Knockout Sportswear.com LLC)	0.0%	We offer a 10% discount on our KO brand custom made items.	
KORNEY BOARD AIDS	0.0%		

Koza's Inc	5.0%	
Leapin Leotards	0.0%	
Leonetti Graphics Inc.	20.0%	
LOGOMATIC	0.0%	
maxi aids	10.0%	
Medco Supply Company (Performance Health Supply)	25.0%	0-25 % Off Catalog Items. See Attached Form For Breakdown Of Discounts. *Shipping Charges Apply At The Time Of Order*
Medicaleshop Inc	1.0%	For Health Athletic Equipment = 1-27% For Health Athletic supplies - 1-5%
MFAC, LLC (M-F Athletic/ Perform Better)	10.0%	10% *Excludes: Sales, Pits, Hurdles, Pole Vault Poles, Crossbars, Timing Systems, Software, Cardio Equip, Weight Equip, In-ground Equip, Items requiring special shipping or truck shipment by common carrier. Other exclusions may apply.
Midway PSG dba Pasadena Sporting Goods	15.0%	
Promaxima	1.0%	PROMAXIMA OFFERS A RANGE OF 1-35% DISCOUNT PRICING. SHIPPING & INSTALL IS NOT INCLUDED IN DISCOUNT PRICING. PLEASE SEE ATTACHED "SHIPPING & INSTALL INSTRUCTIONAL SHEET.
PWI Investment Group, Inc.	5.0%	KN95 (blue box):\$2.75 per mask \$2.50 per piece for bulk orders -FDA and CE-Made with high quality material (more cotton for comfort)KN95 (green box)\$2.50 per mask \$2.25 per piece for bulk orders -FDA and CE-Great mask3-layer mask:\$.80 per mask \$.65 per piece for bulk orders -Bacterial Filtration greater than 99%-FDA and CE-Very comfortable for long hours use (preferred option)Sanitation16.9oz hand sanitizer: \$8.50 per bottle \$8.00 per bottle (bulk orders)-Pump bottle-Gel type32oz disinfectant spray:\$17.50 per bottle \$15.00 per bottle (bulk orders) -Can be used on surfaces to keep Coronavirus and other germs from spreading-Environmentally friendly-spray bottleInfrared Thermometer-Can be used for all facility when entering the building and throughout the day-Instant reading-Fahrenheit and Celsius reading-50 memory slots for previous readingsInfrared Forehead Thermometer (orange):\$75.00 per piece \$65.00 per piece for bulk orders GL Thermometer (purple):\$60.00 per piece \$55.00 per piece for bulk orders UP Thermometer (green box):\$50.00 per piece \$45.00 per piece for bulk orders
Rebel Athletic, Inc (Rebel Athletic)	10.0%	all sideline and competition uniforms
Riddell (Riddell / All American Sports Corp.)	1.0%	Riddell would like to offer a discount of 1-40% from our catalog price on Athletic Supplies.

S&S Worldwide	20.0%	Discount is off of list price at the time the order is placed. Please reference bid#20-0630-23ATH% on correspondence to receive pricing.
SAS Distribution	0.02%	
SAS Distribution		10 pallets=\$0.05 off each bottle, 20 pallets=\$0.10 off each bottle
School Health Corp.	12.0%	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	9.0%	PLEASE SEE THE ATTACHED LIST OF EXCLUDED ITEMS.FREE SHIPPING ON ORDERS OVER \$50.00
School Specialty, Inc	35.0%	35% discount off supply items14% discount off furniture and equipment itemsPlease reference cover letter for details.
SOUTHERN ATHLETIC SUPPLY INC	10.0%	
SPARKLE	0.0%	0-20% based on volume and style.
Speed Stacks, Inc.	0.0%	Speed Stacks instructor pricing is already discounted 15% from our online retail pricing. We do offer a discount on large orders of Sport Packs, however the discount is quoted per order.
Sports Imports	0.0%	
Swim Shops of the Southwest (Adolf Kiefer & Associates)	0.0%	Depends on item 0- 30%
TEAM GO FIGURE (Single Piece Apparel)	0.0%	
Tennis Express	30.0%	We offer 30% off the msrp for tennis apparel and shoes. We also offer discounts on equipment and accessories. Please contact us at Team@TennisExpress.com to get a quote.
Tennis Outlet, Inc.	30.0%	
TEXAS MOTION SPORTS	0.0%	team pricing is listed in our catalogs
Texas Swim Shop (Matherne Inc)	15.0%	Discounts vary from 15-20% depending on the product. Prices will be quoted upon request.
The Costume Closet	0.0%	
The Sensory Kids Store (Sensory Kids, LLC)	10.0%	
The Sensory Kids Store (Sensory Kids, LLC)		Because I work with so many different manufacturers, any discounts must be determined based on the order, quantities, and specific items. Healthcare items typically have lower discounts than Sports Equipment. Discounts generally range between 10%-25% or more.
Troxell Communications, Inc.	1.0%	Discounts vary 1-70% off List Price, by manufacturer, product, and quantity. Contact Adela Briner for quote.
T-Shirt Trends	5.0%	
US Games (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc. dba BSN Sports)	10.0%	US Games 10% off current price with exceptions see attached

VARSITY SPIRIT FASHION (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	0.0%	Varsity is offering a discount of FREE GROUND RATE SHIPPING ONLY for All orders placed under this bid to be accompanied by a School/District method of payment such as a PO, Business Check or Credit Card, or ACH/EFT Payment. Catalogs are released yearly and prices are valid from Jan 1st - Dec 31st of each year. The current catalog can be viewed online at the link following and you Rep can provide full details of our extensive line. <a href="https://www.varsity.com/school/spirit-fashion/2020-VSF-Catalog/">https://www.varsity.com/school/spirit-fashion/2020-VSF-Catalog/</a>
William V. MacGill & Co.	7.0%	7% discount on supplies, 5% discount on select furniture and equipment items. Exclusions apply.
Wisstech Enterprises (William Wissen)	0.0%	

2 Delivery charges		
Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes
Action Wear Plus	\$0.00	
ADDI LLC	\$0.00	
ALERT SERVICES INC	\$0.00	see attached letter on delivery charges
Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	\$0.00	Shipping charges are based on weight and delivery location. Note : "0" was entered as a placeholder to proceed. Shipping will be added to invoice.
BILL FRITZ SPORTS CORP.	\$15.00	
Bio Corporation	\$0.00	free ups ground shipping on orders over \$250.00, no pail packing, no live material
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	\$0.00	F.O.B. DESTINATION / see attached for exceptions
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)	\$5.95	We offer free shipping on orders of \$100 and over, flat rate of \$5.95 for orders under \$100. Expedited shipping charges will apply to expedited orders.
DANZGEAR	\$0.00	FREE GROUND SHIPPING
DJO Global, Inc	\$0.00	Free Shipping on orders over \$750
Educational Products, Inc	\$0.00	Free shipping on all screen printing and embroidery orders
getpoms.com	No Bid	
Golf Team Products	\$0.00	
Got Ya Covered	\$0.00	No delivery cost for PISD
Graphics Store	\$0.00	free shipping to schools for orders of 12qty or more
HALO Branded Solutions, Inc.	\$0.00	Shipping Charges Additional

IRC TEAM SPORTS (INDIANAPOLIS RACQUET CLUB, INC.)	\$25.00	There are shipping charges on court equipment, racquets that are discounted, string, accessories and apparel orders under \$500 from one vendor or under \$1,000 from two or more vendors and tennis balls under 6 cases and shoes. All of these items are subject to weight and size of package.
Knockout Sportswear (Knockout Sportswear.com LLC)	\$25.00	shipping and handling charges depends on quantity/items ordered - usually between \$25-\$55
KORNEY BOARD AIDS	\$12.95	FREE SHIPPING ON ORDERS OVER \$200-EXCLUDING ANY FACTORY FOB ITEMS
Koza's Inc	\$10.00	Orders can be picked up at Koza's or delivery can be arranged. If goods ship from an outside vendor, freight is charged at actual rate.
Leapin Leotards	\$12.00	\$12 minimum and based on current UPS rates
Leonetti Graphics Inc.	\$0.00	
LOGOMATIC	\$0.00	Delivery charges vary and are the exact same as original shippers charge.
maxi aids	\$10.00	see attached for delivery charges
Medco Supply Company (Performance Health Supply)	\$0.00	*Shipping Charges Apply At The Time Of Order*
Medicaleshop Inc	\$1.00	Please refer to deviations #2 and #3 for delivery charges
MFAC, LLC (M-F Athletic/ Perform Better)	\$0.00	
Midway PSG dba Pasadena Sporting Goods	\$0.00	Depends on items shipped and vendor.
Promaxima	\$1.00	PLEASE SEE ATTACHED "SHIPPING & INSTALL INSTRUCTIONAL SHEET.
PWI Investment Group, Inc.	\$0.00	Delivery can be negotiated, most items include delivery. If large quantities are purchased delivery will be included.
Rebel Athletic, Inc (Rebel Athletic)	\$3.00	3-6 % depending on the garments
Riddell (Riddell / All American Sports Corp.)	\$0.00	Most new equipment orders for Athletic equipment will not have freight charges, please see attached letter for the very few exceptions.
S&S Worldwide	\$0.00	Free freight on stock items. Items labeled Dropship/FOB will be charged freight
SAS Distribution	\$100.00	Depends on quantity
School Health Corp.	No Bid	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	\$0.00	FREE SHIPPING ON ORDERS OVER \$50.00
School Specialty, Inc	\$9.95	Prefix 5: \$5 Minimum or 12% charge based on NET subtotal Prefix 9: \$9.95 minimum or free over \$49 based on NET subtotal**Live specimens (prefix L) and hazardous materials (prefix H) may incur additional charges. Please refer to <a href="http://www.schoolspecialty.com">www.schoolspecialty.com</a> for more information. Please reference cover letter for details.
SOUTHERN ATHLETIC SUPPLY INC	\$0.00	

SPARKLE	\$0.00	Free for team orders of 30+ units one style. Smaller order vary. \$7.95-\$25.95
Speed Stacks, Inc.	\$0.00	Speed Stacks offers free shipping for orders >\$100. There is a \$10 charges for orders <\$100.
Sports Imports	\$9.00	delivery charges are 9% on total order. minimum of \$9 shipping.
Swim Shops of the Southwest (Adolf Kiefer & Associates)	\$0.00	Shipping charges depend on items weight/size.
TEAM GO FIGURE (Single Piece Apparel)	\$8.00	<a href="https://www.teamgofigure.com/blog/shipping-information">https://www.teamgofigure.com/blog/shipping-information</a> the number listed above is 8% for ground shippingmore specific shipping fees are located in the link listed here - minimums, air freight and other fees
Tennis Express	\$0.00	Shipping is free for apparel and shoes but might apply to some equipment due to the dimension and weight of the package.
Tennis Outlet, Inc.	\$9.95	Team orders over \$500 will ship free. 6 cases or more of tennis balls ship free. All other items shipping will start at \$9.95
TEXAS MOTION SPORTS	\$3.50	3.5% of order total for shipping, \$12 minimum, unless otherwise specified
Texas Swim Shop (Matherne Inc)	\$20.00	\$20 is a common ship fee. Shipping will vary depending on weight and size of the product. We prepay and bill actual shipping charges. We can bid shipping at the time of bidding the product. Shipping for heavy items and bulky pool equipment will be bid upon request.
The Costume Closet	\$27.95	S&H starts at \$9.95 up to \$60 based on weight of order.
The Sensory Kids Store (Sensory Kids, LLC)	\$100.00	Quoted per order. Best rates and shipping method available at the time. I do not mark-up Shipping. Shipping costs depend on the size and weight of the items being shipped and will be quoted at time of order.
Troxell Communications, Inc.	\$0.00	Freight is generally included in quoted pricing, however occasionally additional shipping & handling charges may apply. See attached Freight Statement for shipping considerations.
T-Shirt Trends	\$25.00	
US Games (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc. dba BSN Sports)	\$0.00	F.O.B. DESTINATION SEE ATTACHED. PRICING SHEET
VARSITY SPIRIT FASHION (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	\$0.00	Free Ground Rate Shipping Bid Discount
William V. MacGill & Co.	\$12.95	\$12.95 on orders less than \$65.00. Call for pricing on equipment and furniture.
Wisstech Enterprises (William Wissen)	\$0.00	Shipping costs are prepaid and added to invoice. Quotes are available by request.

<b>3</b>	<b>Discount for "Factory Ship" items (including furniture equipment)</b>		
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>% Discount</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>



Action Wear Plus	0.0%	
ADDI LLC	0.0%	
ALERT SERVICES INC	0.0%	see attached letter on factory shipped items
Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	5.0%	
BILL FRITZ SPORTS CORP.	10.0%	
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	No Bid	
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)	0.0%	Some discounts and promotions may apply depending on the items, please call our office for exact pricing for specific items.
DANZGEAR	0.0%	OUR CATALOG IS ALREADY DISCOUNTED FOR SCHOOLS AND GROUPS.
DJO Global, Inc	No Bid	
Educational Products, Inc	0.0%	We do not offer furniture
getpoms.com	No Bid	
Golf Team Products	0.0%	
Got Ya Covered	0.0%	This is all done in house, no 3rd party
Graphics Store	No Bid	
IRC TEAM SPORTS (INDIANAPOLIS RACQUET CLUB, INC.)	30.0%	We offer up to 30% off of MSRP on apparel. Team discounts on tennis balls and court equipment.
Knockout Sportswear (Knockout Sportswear.com LLC)	No Bid	
KORNEY BOARD AIDS	0.0%	
Leapin Leotards	0.0%	
Leonetti Graphics Inc.	No Bid	
LOGOMATIC	0.0%	No discount as shipping costs will be the exact same as original shippers charge.
maxi aids	0.0%	
Medco Supply Company (Performance Health Supply)	25.0%	0-25 % Off Catalog Items. See Attached Form For Breakdown Of Discounts. *Shipping Charges Apply At The Time Of Order*
Medicaleshop Inc	1.0%	Please refer to attached exhibit #1 Price list
MFAC, LLC (M-F Athletic/ Perform Better)	No Bid	
Promaxima	No Bid	
PWI Investment Group, Inc.	5.0%	
Rebel Athletic, Inc (Rebel Athletic)	No Bid	
Riddell (Riddell / All American Sports Corp.)	No Bid	
S&S Worldwide	20.0%	
School Health Corp.	No Bid	

SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	9.0%	PLEASE SEE THE ATTACHED LIST OF EXCLUDED ITEMS.FREE SHIPPING ON ORDERS OVER \$50.00
School Specialty, Inc	14.0%	35% discount off supply items14% discount off furniture and equipment itemsPlease reference cover letter for details.
SOUTHERN ATHLETIC SUPPLY INC	10.0%	
SPARKLE	No Bid	
Speed Stacks, Inc.	No Bid	
Sports Imports	0.0%	
Swim Shops of the Southwest (Adolf Kiefer & Associates)	0.0%	
TEAM GO FIGURE (Single Piece Apparel)	0.0%	
Tennis Express	30.0%	30% off the msrp for tennis apparel and shoes
TEXAS MOTION SPORTS	0.0%	
Texas Swim Shop (Matherne Inc)	15.0%	
The Costume Closet	No Bid	
The Sensory Kids Store (Sensory Kids, LLC)		Because I work with so many different manufacturers, any discounts must be determined based on the order, quantities, and specific items. Healthcare items typically have lower discounts than Sports Equipment. Discounts generally range between 10%-25% or more.
Troxell Communications, Inc.	0.0%	Discount availability and amount will vary by manufacturer, product, and quantity. Contact Adela Briner for quote.
T-Shirt Trends	No Bid	
US Games (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc. dba BSN Sports)	No Bid	
VARSITY SPIRIT FASHION (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	0.0%	N/A
Wisstech Enterprises (William Wissen)	0.0%	

4 Shipping costs for Factory Shipped Items		
Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes
Action Wear Plus	\$0.00	
ADDI LLC	\$0.00	
ALERT SERVICES INC	\$0.00	shipping cost on factory shipped items vary
BILL FRITZ SPORTS CORP.	\$15.00	
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	No Bid	
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)	\$5.95	Shipping charges will vary depending on the items, please call our office for exact pricing.
DANZGEAR	\$0.00	FREE GROUND SHIPPING.

DJO Global, Inc	No Bid	
Educational Products, Inc	\$0.00	
getpoms.com	\$20.00	Shipping charges are dependent on order quantity. Each box of poms or streamers typically costs \$15-20 to ship, and the amount of boxes needed depends on pom size. The price to ship megaphones is dependent upon quantity of megaphones ordered. Vendor will always provide shipping cost before order is placed.
Golf Team Products	\$0.00	
Gopher Sport (The Prophet Corporation)	\$0.00	Free shipping on all non truck items with a 17% shipping rate on all truck ship items.
Got Ya Covered	\$0.00	This is all done in house, no 3rd party
Graphics Store	No Bid	
IRC TEAM SPORTS (INDIANAPOLIS RACQUET CLUB, INC.)	\$25.00	Shipping costs are subject to weight and size of packages unless it is for apparel items over \$500 from one vendor or over 1,000 from two or more vendors or on match play tennis balls under six cases from one vendor.
Knockout Sportswear (Knockout Sportswear.com LLC)	No Bid	
Leapin Leotards	\$0.00	
Leonetti Graphics Inc.	No Bid	
LOGOMATIC	\$0.00	Cost is exact same as original shippers charge.
maxi aids	No Bid	
Medco Supply Company (Performance Health Supply)	\$0.00	*Shipping Charges Apply At The Time Of Order*
Medcaleshop Inc	\$1.00	Please refer to attached deviations #2 and #3
MFAC, LLC (M-F Athletic/ Perform Better)	No Bid	
Promaxima	No Bid	
PWI Investment Group, Inc.	\$0.00	
Rebel Athletic, Inc (Rebel Athletic)	No Bid	
Riddell (Riddell / All American Sports Corp.)	No Bid	
School Health Corp.	No Bid	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	\$0.00	FREE SHIPPING ON ORDERS OVER \$50.00
School Specialty, Inc	\$0.00	Prefix 5: \$5 Minimum or 12% charge based on NET subtotal Prefix 9: \$9.95 minimum or free over \$49 based on NET subtotal **Live specimens (prefix L) and hazardous materials (prefix H) may incur additional charges. Please refer to <a href="http://www.schoolspecialty.com">www.schoolspecialty.com</a> for more information. Please reference cover letter for details.
SOUTHERN ATHLETIC SUPPLY INC	\$20.00	
SPARKLE	No Bid	

Speed Stacks, Inc.	No Bid	
Sports Imports	\$9.00	delivery charges are 9% on total order. minimum of \$9 shipping.
TEXAS MOTION SPORTS	\$3.50	3.5% of order total for shipping, \$12 minimum, unless otherwise specified
Texas Swim Shop (Matherne Inc)	\$20.00	\$20 is a common ship fee. Shipping will vary depending on weight and size of the product. We prepay and bill actual shipping charges. We can bid shipping at the time of bidding the product. Shipping for heavy items and bulky pool equipment will be bid upon request.
The Costume Closet	No Bid	
The Sensory Kids Store (Sensory Kids, LLC)	\$100.00	Quoted per order. Best rates available at the time. I do not mark-up Freight. Freight and shipping depends on the size and weight of the items being shipped and will be quoted at time of order.
Troxell Communications, Inc.	\$0.00	Freight is generally included in quoted pricing, however occasionally additional shipping & handling charges may apply. See attached Freight Statement for shipping considerations.
T-Shirt Trends	No Bid	
US Games (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc. dba BSN Sports)	No Bid	
VARSITY SPIRIT FASHION (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	\$0.00	N/A