

**Promotional, Embroidery and Screen Printing**

**RFP # #20-0630-26**

**Contract Expiration Date – June 30, 2025**

**Approved Vendors**

4imprint, Inc.  
A.C.T. Brand Services  
Accent Screenprinting  
Ace T-Shirts (J.A.K. Printwear, Inc)  
Action Wear Plus  
ADDI, LLC  
All Awards & Promotions  
All Out Graphics  
Amazing Awards, Inc  
Anchorage Medical Equipment Supplies, LLC  
Astro Apparel & Uniforms  
Authentic Promotions.com  
Awards by GCT dba Gulf Coast Trophies, LLC  
Awards of Distinction  
Bcustomz, LLC  
Brentwood Marketing, LLC  
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co, Inc)  
Bull Market Promotions  
Challenge Office Products, Inc  
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)  
Clever Items, LLC  
Corporate Incentives, Inc.  
CorporateWear USA  
Custom Sportwear, Inc  
D.Zine Graphics  
DANZGEAR  
DBS Texas - Houston  
Educational Products, Inc  
Fort Worth Running Company Houston (Kevin P. Simms)  
Fully Promoted of Webster (McCalla Enterprises, LLC)  
G&C Screen Printing  
Gandy Ink (G&G Investments)  
Gateway Printing & Office Supply  
Got Ya Covered  
Graphic Icons  
Graphic Store  
HALO Branded Solutions, Inc.

Imprint Resources  
Inked Designs  
Insight Branding (Tarheel Promotions)  
JR Engraving  
Knockout Sportswear  
Koza's  
KriStitch  
Leonetti Graphics  
Liberty Data Products (Liberty Office Products)  
Logomatic  
Lone Star Engraving  
Northwest Engravers  
NW Digital Works, LLC  
Positive Promotions, Inc  
Pride and Recognition, Inc (dba Balfour)  
Print Central  
Revolution Printing  
Riddell (All American Sports Corp)  
School Life a div of imagestuff  
School Tee Factory (Custom Sportswear, Inc.)  
Southern Athletic Supply, Inc  
SSR JACKETS (MONK HOLDINGS, LLC)  
Tejas Office Products  
Texas Embellishment Experts Corp  
Texas Ink  
Texas Motion Sports  
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc  
The Donatto Group  
The Master Teacher  
Tote, Inc. (Tote Unlimited)  
T-Shirt Trends  
West Road Printing (Dist. Alfa Y Omega)  
X-Grain Sportswear (Inventory Trading Company)

1	Percentage Discount		
Supplier	% Discount	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	
4imprint, Inc.	10.0%	Please see attached proposal for details	
A.C.T. Brand Services	10.0%		
ACCENT SCREENPRINTING	20.0%		
Ace T-Shirts (J.A.K. Printwear, Inc.)	12.0%		
Action Wear Plus	15.0%		
ADDI LLC	5.0%		
All Awards & Promotions	5.0%	under \$500	
All Awards & Promotions	10.0%	\$501-\$1,000	
All Awards & Promotions	15.0%	\$1001 and up	
All Out Graphics	5.0%		
AMAZING AWARDS INC	23.5%		
Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	5.0%		
Astro Apparel & Uniforms	25.0%		
Authentic Promotions.com	20.0%	We offer a 20% discount off first column pricing. A set up charge and/or running charge may apply depending on how item needs to be decorated.	
Awards By GCT	20.0%		
AWARDS OF DISTINCTION	10.0%	0%-25% depending on qty ordered	
BCustomz,LLC (Barbara Myers)	30.0%	30 % off	
Brentwood Marketing, LLC	5.0%	Brentwood offers a 5% discount to all school, club, or team orders. This may increase up to 25% depending on the item, the quantity, and other factors. E.g. Most awards and plaques would qualify for the higher discounts. Also name brands such as Adidas, Nike, or Russel will usually receive a 10-15% discount.	
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	30.0%	BSN SPORTS TEAM WEAR CATALOG 30% off catalog price all Nike, UA, New Balance, Asics apparel and bags BSN SPORTS TEAM WORK 20% BSN, Badger, alleson, Promo items etc... see catalog with min 6 for embroidery, 12 for screen print and 12 for promo items	
Bull Market Promotions	20.0%		
Challenge Office Products,Inc.	20.0%	Discounts can vary from 5-25% - custom items are quoted on an individual basis	
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)	10.0%	We will offer 15% off uniforms and warm ups, 10% off all other apparel and accessories. No additional discounts on clearance/closeout items. Other promotions may apply.	
Clever Items, LLC	0.0%		

Corporate Incentives, Inc.	0.0%	
Corporate Incentives, Inc.		We will provide EQP pricing for a majority of our products. The discount will be from 18-30%, pending on the product/quantity.
CorporateWear USA (Corporate FX)	10.0%	
Custom Sportswear, Inc.	0.0%	
D.Zine Graphics	10.0%	
DANZGEAR	0.0%	OUR CATALOG IS ALREADY DISCOUNTED FOR SCHOOLS AND GROUPS.
DBS Texas- Houston	12.0%	
Educational Products, Inc	5.0%	Discount does not apply to flyer pricing and other incentives that are being offered during a promotional time. The Sales Rep for PISD will provide a quote with competitive pricing and discounts that pertain to their specific order.
Fort Worth Running Company Houston (Kevin P Simms)	10.0%	
Fully Promoted of Webster (McCalla Enterprises, LLC)	12.0%	The 12% discount is the minimum percentage discount off listed regular retail price. The discount does not apply to sale items. If deeper discounts are available, Fully Promoted Webster will pass those discounts on to the Pearland ISD. The online catalog can be found at: <a href="https://fullypromotedwebster.espwebsite.com/">https://fullypromotedwebster.espwebsite.com/</a>
G&C Screen Printing	10.0%	10% From Catalog
Gandy Ink (G & G Investments)	0.0%	Our pricing is net pricing with quantity price breaks that equate to a 5% to 15% discount per quantity break. There are no added charges for art, set-up, digitizing, shipping or 2xl and 3xl sizes. On most screen printed shirts we give 5 free shirts for every 50 ordered. Our products and prices are on our website at <a href="http://www.gandyink.com">www.gandyink.com</a> .
Gateway Printing & Office Supply	10.0%	
Got Ya Covered	0.0%	Bulk orders are discounted on volume, difficult to make a standard discount not knowing size of order.
Graphic Icons	10.0%	
Graphics Store	5.0%	Graphics Store provide customer apparel through embroidery and screen printing – hats, t-shirts, sweatshirts/pants, bags and various promotional items. Discounts ranges from 5-20%, based on the quantity ordered. We also offer the Shirt Angel program for schools/non-profits. Receive 3 free shirts for every 30 shirts your order of the same design. This applies to garment style 5000, youth small – adult extra large.
HALO Branded Solutions, Inc.	5.0%	
Imprint Resources	0.0%	0-35% See attached Bid Deviations

		Please see the SPECIAL PRICING sheet that we give to Pearland ISD that is included in the Response Attachments - there is not a specific % discount for every situation/count/color
Inked Designs	1.0%	
Insight Branding (Tarheel Promotions)	5.0%	Discount will depend on size of order and can range from 5-15%
JR Engraving (ALJOKA ENTERPRISES, INC.)	40.0%	JR ENGRAVING OFFERS UP TO 40% DISCOUNT DEPENDING UPON ITEM AND QUANTITY.
Knockout Sportswear	0.0%	We offer a 10% discount on our KO brand custom sublimated items.
Koza's Inc	5.0%	
KriStitch	0.0%	Discounts are determined by quantity, # of colors printed, production time, number of stitches (for embroidered items) so it's not a set discount
Leonetti Graphics Inc.	20.0%	
Liberty Data Products (Liberty Office Products)	15.0%	
LOGOMATIC	0.0%	
Lone Star Engraving	10.0%	
Northwest Engravers	20.0%	
NW Digital Works, LLC	12.0%	Discounts are offered at 12% to 18% off standard catalog pricing. Larger orders may receive additional discount consideration.
Positive Promotions, Inc.	5.0%	
Pride and Recognition, inc. (dba Balfour)	20.0%	
Print Central	0.0%	Discount Depending on the size of the order also give the sale prices on the shirt if there on sale...
REVOLUTION PRINTING	30.0%	30 to 40% depending on quantity
Riddell (Riddell / All American Sports Corp.)	1.0%	Riddell would like to offer a discount of 1-40% from list/catalog price on all items in our 2020 Catalog. Please see attached letter for more information.
School Life, a div. of imagestuff	0.0%	
School Tee Factory (Custom Sportswear, Inc.)	0.0%	
SOUTHERN ATHLETIC SUPPLY INC	10.0%	
SSR JACKETS (MONK HOLDINGS, LLC)	40.0%	OUR PRICING IS 40% - 70% OFF CATALOG PRICING. www.chenille.comOUR PRICING DEPENDS ON QUANTITY.
Tejas Office Products	25.0%	
Texas Embellishment Experts Corp	20.0%	
Texas Embellishment Experts Corp		discount ranges from 20-50% depending on items/service
Texas Ink	0.0%	
TEXAS MOTION SPORTS	0.0%	team pricing is listed in our catalogs
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc	10.0%	

The Donatto Group	24.0%	
The Master Teacher	0.0%	
TOTE, INC. (TOTE UNLIMITED)	0.0%	
T-Shirt Trends	0.0%	
West Road Printing (Dist. Alfa Y Omega)	0.0%	There is a range of discounts. Our prices are discounted wholesale pricing. All printing and embroidery pricing varies according to the quantity, locations to be decorated, and type of garment, and stitch count (embroidery) or amount of colors in the design (printing). The more that is ordered in quantity the higher the discount.
X-GRAIN SPORTSWEAR (INVENTORY TRADING COMPANY)	0.0%	-0-% but we do have a FREE GARMENTS PROGRAM based on quantity purchased. Order 16 items get 1 of equal or lesser value for free, order 30 items get 2, order 43 get 3, order 56 get 4, order 70 get 6, or 86 get 8, order 102 get 9 and so on.

2 Delivery charges		
Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes
4imprint, Inc.	No Bid	Shipping is to be FOB Destination and Prepaid and Allowed and is based on weight and distance as well as ship method chosen by customer.
A.C.T. Brand Services	\$0.00	
ACCENT SCREENPRINTING	\$0.00	Any order over \$1,000 qualifies for free delivery. All other orders will be quoted the UPS rate based on weight.
Ace T-Shirts (J.A.K. Printwear, Inc.)	\$0.00	
Action Wear Plus	\$0.00	
ADDI LLC	\$0.00	
All Awards & Promotions	\$25.00	This can vary depending on weight, we do not charge a flat rate
All Out Graphics	\$0.00	
AMAZING AWARDS INC	\$0.00	All delivery charges are FOB destination and are passed directly to customer. NO MARK UP ON DELIVERY CHARGES.
Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	\$0.00	"(0)" is entered as a placeholder to proceed. Shipping charges are based on order weight and delivery location.
Astro Apparel & Uniforms	\$0.00	
Authentic Promotions.com	\$0.00	No Charge for ground shipping
Awards By GCT	\$0.00	
AWARDS OF DISTINCTION	\$10.00	Actual Freight charges from vendors
BCustomz,LLC (Barbara Myers)	\$30.00	Delivery charges is based on location and order. Free- 30 percent off.
Brentwood Marketing, LLC	\$0.00	On less otherwise requested or there are unusual conditions, any prices quoted by Brentwood to a school or to the District would include all delivery charges.

BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	\$0.00	F.O.B. DESTINATION / 2 - 60 DAYS ARO
Bull Market Promotions	\$0.00	
Challenge Office Products, Inc.	\$1.00	delivery/shipment charges are based on weight, how many per carton, and size. Pricing is based on the item.
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)	\$5.95	We offer free shipping on orders \$100 and over, flat rate of \$5.95 for orders under \$100. Expedited shipping charges will apply.
Clever Items, LLC	\$0.00	
Corporate Incentives, Inc.	\$0.00	Freight charges will vary depending on item, quantity and delivery method/location.
CorporateWear USA (Corporate FX)	No Bid	
Custom Sportswear, Inc.	\$0.00	
D.Zine Graphics	\$0.00	
DANZGEAR	\$0.00	FREE GROUND SHIPPING
DBS Texas- Houston	\$0.00	
Educational Products, Inc	\$0.00	FREE delivery as we do not charge for any shipping fees
Fort Worth Running Company Houston (Kevin P Simms)	\$0.00	
Fully Promoted of Webster (McCalla Enterprises, LLC)	No Bid	Delivery charges vary based on size and quantity of items ordered. Fully Promoted Webster will work to find the most cost-effective delivery option for each order. Delivery charges are actual charges and do not include any mark up.
G&C Screen Printing	\$10.00	
Gandy Ink (G & G Investments)	\$0.00	Free shipping.
Gateway Printing & Office Supply	\$0.00	
Got Ya Covered	\$0.00	No delivery cost charged to PISD
Graphic Icons	\$0.00	
Graphics Store	\$0.00	
HALO Branded Solutions, Inc.	No Bid	
Imprint Resources	\$0.00	See attached Bid Deviations
Inked Designs	\$15.00	
Insight Branding (Tarheel Promotions)	\$1.00	Delivery charges will have to be quoted for every order based on item, item quantity and origin of shipping. Some items may not incur any shipping if I am able to deliver them in person.
JR Engraving (ALJOKA ENTERPRISES, INC.)	\$15.00	JR ENGRAVING USES U. S. POSTAL SERVICE PRIORITY MAIL, RATES FROM \$10.00 TO \$25.00
Knockout Sportswear (Knockout Sportswear.com LLC)	\$25.00	Shipping and handling depends on quantity/items ordered - usually between \$25-\$55
Koza's Inc	No Bid	

KriStitch	\$0.00	
Leonetti Graphics Inc.	\$0.00	
Liberty Data Products (Liberty Office Products)	\$0.00	
LOGOMATIC	\$0.00	DISTRICT IS CHARGED THE EXACT SAME SHIPPING CHARGE BILLED TO LOGOMATIC FROM MFG.
Lone Star Engraving	\$20.00	
Northwest Engravers	\$0.00	To be Determined per item
NW Digital Works, LLC	\$0.00	Delivery charges are prepaid and added to each invoice
Positive Promotions, Inc.	\$0.00	FREE Standard shipping. If express, rush shipments or any other special conditions, such as multiple drop shipment locations are requested, the fees associated with these shipments will apply. Discount or FREE Standard shipping cannot be combined with any other promotional or discounted pricing, sale pricing or any other special offers.
Pride and Recognition, inc. (dba Balfour)	\$0.00	There is no delivery charge to the schools
Print Central	\$0.00	
REVOLUTION PRINTING	\$0.00	
Riddell (Riddell / All American Sports Corp.)	\$0.00	There will be no delivery or freight charges on apparel or new equipment orders . Please see attached letter for more information.
School Life, a div. of imagestuff	\$15.00	Shipping is based on the weight of the order. Estimates available on line at <a href="http://www.schoollife.com">www.schoollife.com</a>
School Tee Factory (Custom Sportswear, Inc.)	\$0.00	
SOUTHERN ATHLETIC SUPPLY INC	\$0.00	
SSR JACKETS (MONK HOLDINGS, LLC)	\$0.00	WE DO NOT CHARGE FOR DELIVERY IF SHIPPED TO A SCHOOL DISTRICT FACILITY.
Tejas Office Products	\$0.00	Some shipping will apply, items will be quoted at time of order.
Texas Embellishment Experts Corp	\$15.00	varies per number of boxes shipped...
Texas Ink	\$25.00	Varies depending on size of order.
TEXAS MOTION SPORTS	\$3.50	3.5% of order total, \$12 minimum, unless otherwise specified
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc	\$0.00	Free shipping
The Donatto Group	\$0.00	
The Master Teacher	\$0.00	Shipping is FOB Destination Prepay and added to invoice. Approximately 10% of order total on purchases. Charges are based on weight and distance.
TOTE, INC. (TOTE UNLIMITED)	\$0.00	SHIPPING IS CALCULATED AT TIME OF SHIPMENT BY UPS. QUOTE CAN BE GIVEN WITH ESTIMATED SHIPPING.



T-Shirt Trends	\$25.00	Shipping and delivery charges apply to Promotional products based on weight of item. If ordering apparel or accessories less than minimum delivery charges will apply.
West Road Printing (Dist. Alfa Y Omega)	\$0.00	No Freight / Delivery Charge
X-GRAIN SPORTSWEAR (INVENTORY TRADING COMPANY)	\$12.00	On orders of 8 or more items, shipping is free to school but on less then 8 items you incur a \$12 shipping/handling fee.

<b>3 Discount on special order items</b>		
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>% Discount</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>
4imprint, Inc.	10.0%	Please see attached proposal for details
A.C.T. Brand Services	10.0%	
ACCENT SCREENPRINTING	20.0%	
Ace T-Shirts (J.A.K. Printwear, Inc.)	12.0%	
Action Wear Plus	15.0%	
ADDI LLC	0.0%	
All Awards & Promotions	No Bid	
All Out Graphics	5.0%	
AMAZING AWARDS INC	23.5%	
Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	0.0%	
Astro Apparel & Uniforms	30.0%	
Authentic Promotions.com	5.0%	
AWARDS OF DISTINCTION (AWARDS OF DISTINCTION, INC.)	10.0%	
BCustomz,LLC (Barbara Myers)	30.0%	30 percent off
Brentwood Marketing, LLC	15.0%	Discounts on special order items will vary depending on the item, the vendor, the quantity, or other factors. This discount will usually be in the 10-20% range.
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.)	No Bid	
Bull Market Promotions	20.0%	
Challenge Office Products,Inc.	20.0%	Discounts can vary from 5-25%. There is no blanket discount. Each custom item is quoted on an individual basic.
Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc)	0.0%	Discounts will vary depending on the items, please contact our office for pricing and discount options.
Clever Items, LLC	0.0%	
CorporateWear USA (Corporate FX)	10.0%	
Custom Sportswear, Inc.	0.0%	
D.Zine Graphics	10.0%	

DANZGEAR	0.0%	EVEN SPECIAL ORDER ITEMS WILL BE DISCOUNTED FOR GROUPS.
DBS Texas- Houston	12.0%	
Educational Products, Inc	5.0%	
Fort Worth Running Company Houston (Kevin P Simms)	10.0%	
Fully Promoted of Webster (McCalla Enterprises, LLC)	12.0%	The 12% discount is the minimum percentage discount off listed regular retail price. The discount does not apply to sale items. If deeper discounts are available, Fully Promoted Webster will pass those discount on to the Pearland ISD. The online catalog can be found at: <a href="https://fullypromotedwebster.espwebsite.com/">https://fullypromotedwebster.espwebsite.com/</a>
G&C Screen Printing	0.0%	
Gandy Ink (G & G Investments)	0.0%	
Gateway Printing & Office Supply	10.0%	
Got Ya Covered	0.0%	All items requested will be bid on per item.
Graphics Store	5.0%	
HALO Branded Solutions, Inc.	5.0%	
Imprint Resources	0.0%	See attached Bid Deviations
Inked Designs	1.0%	Please see the SPECIAL PRICING sheet that we give to Pearland ISD that is included in the Response Attachments - - there is not a specific % discount for every situation/count/color
JR Engraving (ALJOKA ENTERPRISES, INC.)	40.0%	JR ENGRAVING OFFERS UP TO 40% DISCOUNT DEPENDING UPON ITEM AND QUANTITY.
Knockout Sportswear	0.0%	We offer a 10% discount on our KO brand custom sublimated items.
KriStitch	0.0%	Discounts are determined by quantity, # of colors printed, production time, number of stitches (for embroidered items) so it's not a set discount
Leonetti Graphics Inc.	20.0%	
Liberty Data Products (Liberty Office Products)	15.0%	
LOGOMATIC	0.0%	
Lone Star Engraving	10.0%	
Northwest Engravers	0.0%	To be Determined per item
NW Digital Works, LLC	12.0%	Discounts are offered at 12% to 18% off standard catalog pricing. Larger orders may receive additional discount consideration.
Pride and Recognition, inc. (dba Balfour)	20.0%	
REVOLUTION PRINTING	30.0%	30 to 40% depending on quantity
Riddell (Riddell / All American Sports Corp.)	1.0%	Riddell would like to offer a discount of 1-40% from list/catalog price on all items in our 2020 Catalog. Please see attached letter for more information. There is a minimum of 12 Custom Apparel items.

School Life, a div. of imagestuff	0.0%	
School Tee Factory (Custom Sportswear, Inc.)	0.0%	
SOUTHERN ATHLETIC SUPPLY INC	10.0%	
SSR JACKETS (MONK HOLDINGS, LLC)	40.0%	OUR PRICING IS 40% - 70% OFF CATALOG PRICING. www.chenille.comOUR PRICING DEPENDS ON QUANTITY.
Tejas Office Products	25.0%	
Texas Ink	0.0%	
TEXAS MOTION SPORTS	0.0%	team pricing is listed in our catalogs
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc	0.0%	
The Donatto Group	5.0%	
The Master Teacher	0.0%	
TOTE, INC. (TOTE UNLIMITED)	0.0%	
West Road Printing (Dist. Alfa Y Omega)	0.0%	There is a range of discounts. Our prices are discounted wholesale pricing. All printing and embroidery pricing varies according to the quantity, locations to be decorated, and type of garment, and stitch count (embroidery) or amount of colors in the design (printing). The more that is ordered in quantity the higher the discount.
X-GRAIN SPORTSWEAR (INVENTORY TRADING COMPANY)	0.0%	-0-% but we do have a FREE GARMENTS PROGRAM based on quantity purchased. Order 16 items get 1 of equal or lesser value for free, order 30 items get 2, order 43 get 3, order 56 get 4, order 70 get 6, or 86 get 8, order 102 get 9 and so on.