

## **SPECIAL PROGRAMS CONTRACTED SERVICES**

RFP #20-0630-20

Approved Vendors

Contract expiration date – July 30, 2025

### **VENDORS**

Advanced Medical Personnel Services, Inc

AmplioSpeech, Inc.

Bee Social Network

Behavior Plus, Inc

CC Assessment Services

Counseling Connections for Change, Inc

Diversified Behavioral Healthcare, LLC

DotCom Therapy

EDU Healthcare, LLC

Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC

Griffin Assessments & Psychological Services

LATT Evaluation and Services, PLLC (La Shaun Arzu, PLLC)

Med-Tech & Design Associates, Inc

National Federation of the Blind of Texas

Nurses Etc Staffing (Donald L. Mooney Enterprises, LLC)

Prentke Romich Company

PresenceLearning, Inc

SignGlasses

SLP Toolkit, LLC

Texas Association of School Boards

Therapia Staffing, LLC

Therapy Source, Inc

TheraV, Inc

TouchMath Acquisition, LLC

1	If you are to be paid PER HOUR, please give your HOURLY RATE. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Hour. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed).			Minimum Hours	Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	If you will bill a minimum number of hours, please indicate the minimum number of hours you would bill the Department here:	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Advanced Medical Personnel Services, Inc.	\$85.00	SLP, OT, PT: \$70-75 p/hr.*LSSP, BCBA: \$80-85 p/hr.*RN, LPN: \$65-70 p/hr.*Bilingual SLP, OT, PT: \$75-80 p/hr.*Bilingual LSSP, BCBA:\$85-90 p/hr.*Bilingual RN, LPN: \$70-75 p/hr.*Teletherapist: Upon RequestBilingual Teletherapist: Upon RequestTherapy Assistant (SLPA, COTA, PTA): \$60-65 p/hr.*Clinical Fellow (CF)See attached proposal cost sheet for more details	n/a, Advanced charges per hours worked	SLP, OT, PT: \$70-75 p/hr., LSSP, BCBA: \$80-85 p/hr.*, RN, LPN: \$65-70 p/hr.*
	AmplioSpeech, Inc.	No Bid			
	Bee Social Network	No Bid			
	Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid			
	CC Assessment Services	\$95.00	504/ARD/IEP Meetings	1	

Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	\$75.00	For counseling of students and their families in-person or through telehealth, the hourly rate is \$75.00. For late cancellations and/or no-shows less than 48 hours without an illness or emergency excuse, the hourly rate is \$75.00. For 1-1 staff consulting with TBRI Practitioners, the hourly rate is \$75.00. For monthly "trauma talks" online zoom call, the hourly rate is \$75.00.	25	We will charge \$75/clinical hour for any students who cannot qualify for a grant or any student, who is unable to utilize their insurance benefits.
Diversified Behavioral Healthcare, LLC	\$80.00			
DotCom Therapy	\$75.00	Please see attached Proposal for rate details: \$70/hour for SLP, OT, LCSW; \$75/hour for LSSP and EdAud	no minimum	\$70-75/hour depending on type of service (See exhibit C-Fee Structure in Attached Proposal)
EDU Healthcare, LLC	\$70.00			School Psych - \$70 Ed Diagnostician \$ 65 O & M \$70 SLP - \$65 TVI - \$60 OT - \$65 RN \$ 50 PT \$65
Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC	\$68.00			Prior contracts have been billed between 12 and 19.5 hours per week across 36 weeks for a range of \$29,376 to \$47,736

Griffin Assessment & Psychological Services	\$75.00		1 hour minimum	\$75.00 per hour (rate applicable for billing less than 3 hours per day); \$68.00 per hour for more than 3 billable hours (see Line Item 2)
LATT Evaluations and Services, PLLC (La Shaun Arzu, PLLC)	\$100.00	Counseling, speech, staff/parent training, nursing, social worker, and ARD/MDR/504 services are billed at hourly rates. Evaluations are flat rates (see attached fee schedule)	minimum 1 hour	\$50-\$100
Med-Tech & Design Associates Inc	\$89.00	This service does not require a hourly charge. This rate is for labor costs.		We usually don't charge labor costs on any repairs for schools, we only charge for parts needed.
National Federation of the Blind of Texas	\$55.00			
NURSES Etc STAFFING (Donald L. Mooney Enterprises, LLC)	\$85.00	Please see the associated document in the Response Attachment tab for more details on pricing	4	42-85
Prentke Romich Company	\$100.00		1-4 hours	see above
PresenceLearning, Inc.	\$73.00		n/a	Services are billed hourly. However, assessments and screenings are billed per component. These prices can be found in the price proposal accompanying this bid.

SignGlasses	\$67.20	Sign language interpreting: \$67.20/hour Typewell transcribing: \$67.20/hour	1	N/A
SLP Toolkit LLC	No Bid			
Texas Association of School Boards	\$100.00	Per hour rates are for off-site services provided to the district.		
Therapia Staffing, LLC. (954-866-0477)	\$65.00	Licensed Specialist in School Psychology \$75 Sign Language Interpreting Services \$62 Occupational Therapy \$65 Certified Occupational Therapy Assistant \$55 Physical Therapy \$65 Physical Therapy Assistant \$55 O&M Services \$65 Educational Diagnostician \$75 Speech Language Pathology \$65 Speech Language Pathology Assistant \$55 Teacher for the Visually Impaired \$65 Teacher for the Deaf/Hard of Hearing \$65 Special Education Teacher \$65 Music Therapy \$62 Art Therapy \$62 Behavioral Therapist \$80 Dyslexia Evaluator \$55	2	60-80
Therapy Source, Inc.	\$68.00	This rate provided of \$68.00/hour is for Physical Therapy, Occupational Therapy, Speech Language Pathologist, and Audiology Services Therapy Source has different hourly rates for other services provided. A full list of hourly rates has included a cost proposal in the attachments.		
TheraV Inc	\$80.00	\$72/hr includes the 10% discount available. This rate is for providing online speech therapy services	40 hr/week for therapy services	72-80
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid			

**2** If you are to be paid PER DAY, please give your DAILY RATE. If your services are not billed per day please click on "NO BID" . (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed).

**Rate Range**

Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
Advanced Medical Personnel Services, Inc.	No Bid		
AmplioSpeech, Inc.	No Bid		
Bee Social Network	\$5,000.00	Two BCBA consultants participate in staff development and classroom consultation. The daily rate of \$5000 includes lodging, travel and per diem fees	5000.00 per day
Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid		
CC Assessment Services	No Bid		
Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	\$1,500.00	The specialized Caregiver Training for TBRI model is 2 day model at a daily rate of \$1500/day for a total of \$3000/training. This training requires two trained practitioners. This training requires 16 direct hours, which can be divided as needed to accommodate schedules. The trainers/practitioners are responsible for providing all handouts, snacks, tangibles and preparation time prior to the event at no charge to the district.	
Diversified Behavioral Healthcare, LLC	\$800.00		negotiable
DotCom Therapy	No Bid		
EDU Healthcare, LLC	No Bid		
Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC	No Bid		
Griffin Assessment & Psychological Services	\$408.00		\$408.00 per day ("per day" billing based on 6 hour work day) \$204.00 per 1/2 day (1/2 day based on 3 hours).

LATT Evaluations and Services, PLLC (La Shaun Arzu, PLLC)	\$800.00	Counseling, speech, staff/parent training, nursing, social worker, and ARD/MDR/504 services up to 8 hours/day; minimum 1 hour	400-800
Med-Tech & Design Associates Inc	No Bid		
National Federation of the Blind of Texas	No Bid		
NURSES Etc STAFFING (Donald L. Mooney Enterprises, LLC)	No Bid		
Prentke Romich Company	No Bid		3 days to 4 weeks
PresenceLearning, Inc.	No Bid		
SignGlasses	No Bid		
SLP Toolkit LLC	No Bid		
Texas Association of School Boards	\$1,500.00	Per day rates are for on-site services provided to the district.	
Therapia Staffing, LLC. (954-866-0477)	No Bid		
Therapy Source, Inc.	No Bid		
TheraV Inc	No Bid		
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid		

3	<b>If you are to be paid PER PARTICIPANT, please give your RATE PER PARTICIPANT. If your services are not billed per participant please click on "NO BID" .(Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed).</b>			<b>Rate Range</b>
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Please specify here the range of pricing:</b>
	Advanced Medical Personnel Services, Inc.	No Bid		
	AmplioSpeech, Inc.	\$315.00		\$315 per student per month. Minimum caseload of 35 students. Average of 30 minutes IEP time per student per week
	Bee Social Network	No Bid		
	Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid		

CC Assessment Services	No Bid		
Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	No Bid		
Diversified Behavioral Healthcare, LLC	\$1,200.00		negotiable
DotCom Therapy	No Bid		
EDU Healthcare, LLC	No Bid		
Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC	No Bid		
Griffin Assessment & Psychological Services	No Bid		
LATT Evaluations and Services, PLLC (La Shaun Arzu, PLLC)	\$1,300.00	Counseling, speech, staff/parent training, nursing, social worker, and ARD/MDR/504 services are billed at hourly rates (minimum 1 hour). Evaluations are flat rates (see attached fee schedule)	300-1300
Med-Tech & Design Associates Inc	No Bid	Cost of calibration/pm for each piece of equipment.	
National Federation of the Blind of Texas	No Bid		
NURSES Etc STAFFING (Donald L. Mooney Enterprises, LLC)	No Bid		
Prentke Romich Company	No Bid		N/A
PresenceLearning, Inc.	\$1,920.00		
SignGlasses	No Bid		
SLP Toolkit LLC	\$215.00	Subscriptions are based per user. For 0-24 users, the rate is \$215 per person. For 25-74 users, the rate is \$195 per user. For 75+ users, the rate is \$180 per user.	
Texas Association of School Boards	No Bid		
Therapia Staffing, LLC. (954-866-0477)	No Bid		
Therapy Source, Inc.	No Bid		
TheraV Inc	\$50.00		
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid		

4	If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please give your PER EVENT RATE (Examples of this type of service may include, but not be limited to: speaker at In-service trainings, professional development events, session, etc.). If your services are not billed per Event please click on "NO BID" .			
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Rate Range Please specify here the range of pricing:

Advanced Medical Personnel Services, Inc.	No Bid		
AmplioSpeech, Inc.	No Bid		
Bee Social Network	\$6,000.00	Price include presenter fees for two BCBA's and participant activity materials.	
Behavior Plus, Inc.	No Bid		
			rate: English speaking students Cognitive/Achievement: 1,200 Psychological:1,200 Dyslexia evaluation (stand-alone): 1,000.00 Cognitive/Achievement w/ Dyslexia: 1,500 Spanish speaking students: Cognitive /Achievement/and /or psychological: 1400.00 Dyslexia Evaluation included with Cognitive/Achievement: 1,500 Dyslexia Evaluation (stand-alone): 1000.00 Counseling Assessment: 500.00
CC Assessment Services	\$1,400.00		504
Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	No Bid		
Diversified Behavioral Healthcare, LLC	No Bid		
DotCom Therapy	No Bid		
EDU Healthcare, LLC	No Bid		

Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC	No Bid		
Griffin Assessment & Psychological Services	No Bid		
LATT Evaluations and Services, PLLC (La Shaun Arzu, PLLC)	\$800.00	Counseling, speech, staff/parent training, nursing, social worker, and ARD/MDR/504 services up to 8 hours/day/event; minimum 1 hour	400-800
Med-Tech & Design Associates Inc	No Bid		
National Federation of the Blind of Texas	No Bid		
NURSES Etc STAFFING (Donald L. Mooney Enterprises, LLC)	No Bid		
Prentke Romich Company	No Bid		N/A
PresenceLearning, Inc.	No Bid		
SignGlasses	No Bid		
SLP Toolkit LLC	No Bid		
Texas Association of School Boards	No Bid		
Therapia Staffing, LLC. (954-866-0477)	No Bid		
Therapy Source, Inc.	No Bid		
TheraV Inc	No Bid		
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	\$4,000.00	Please see our TouchMath University Catalog for a full listing of trainings and pricing. Price listed is for in-person training. Virtual training is \$1250.	

5	<b>If you are to be paid LUMP SUM, please give your rate. If your services are not billed per LUMP SUM please click on "NO BID" . (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Lump Sum. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed).</b>			
				<b>Rate Range</b>
				<b>Please specify here the range of pricing:</b>

Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	No Bid		
Diversified Behavioral Healthcare, LLC	No Bid		
DotCom Therapy	No Bid		
EDU Healthcare, LLC	No Bid		
Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC	No Bid		
Griffin Assessment & Psychological Services	No Bid		
LATT Evaluations and Services, PLLC (La Shaun Arzu, PLLC)	\$1,300.00	Evaluations are flat rates (see attached fee schedule)	300-1300
Med-Tech & Design Associates Inc	\$34.00	Final lump sum amount will depend on how many pieces of equipment is serviced.	\$34 per item
National Federation of the Blind of Texas	No Bid		
NURSES Etc STAFFING (Donald L. Mooney Enterprises, LLC)	No Bid		
Prentke Romich Company	No Bid		N/A
PresenceLearning, Inc.	No Bid		
SignGlasses	No Bid		
SLP Toolkit LLC	No Bid		
Texas Association of School Boards	No Bid		
Therapia Staffing, LLC. (954-866-0477)	No Bid		
Therapy Source, Inc.	No Bid		
TheraV Inc	No Bid		
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid		

6	<p><b>If you are to be paid PER SITE (LOCATION), please give your rate. If your services are not billed PER SITE please click on "NO BID" . (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Location. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed).</b></p>			
				<b>Rate Range</b>
				<b>Please specify here the range of pricing:</b>

Diversified Behavioral Healthcare, LLC	No Bid	
DotCom Therapy	No Bid	
EDU Healthcare, LLC	No Bid	
Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC	No Bid	
Griffin Assessment & Psychological Services	No Bid	
LATT Evaluations and Services, PLLC (La Shaun Arzu, PLLC)	No Bid	
Med-Tech & Design Associates Inc	No Bid	
National Federation of the Blind of Texas	No Bid	
NURSES Etc STAFFING (Donald L. Mooney Enterprises, LLC)	No Bid	
Prentke Romich Company	No Bid	N/A
PresenceLearning, Inc.	No Bid	
SignGlasses	No Bid	
SLP Toolkit LLC	No Bid	
Texas Association of School Boards	No Bid	
Therapia Staffing, LLC. (954-866-0477)	No Bid	
Therapy Source, Inc.	No Bid	
TheraV Inc	No Bid	
TouchMath Acquisition LLC	No Bid	