

District-Wide Contracted Services
RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration Date – June 30, 2026
Approved Vendors

Aaron Daffern Consulting
Aha Education, LLC
Alvarez Striping
Ameriturf
Be Well, Lead Well LLC
Betty Busby
Bilinguistics, Inc.
Cady Studios, LLC
Corwin Press, Inc
Creative Mathematics
CRW Consulting, LLC
DB3 Unlimited Services, LLC
DeltaMath Solutions Inc.
DPW Educational Consulting
Dr. Yacovodonato Educational Consulting
Frontline Education
Greasekleen Industries
Interquest Group Inc.
Josh Stumpfenhorst
Kristi Powitzky
Lifetouch NSS
Little Learners Literacy Academy
Monsido
National Literacy Institute
New Teacher Center
Nicki Booker LLC
NOCTI
Plurasight, LLC
RC Health Services
Rivet Education
S3strategies, LLC
Sharron Helmke
Shielding Hearts
Shine Bright Tutoring
SPC of Texas
StormGeo, Inc.

The Ddance Group, Inc.

The Process Manager

Think Behaviorally, PLLC.

Thomas Educational Solutions

William and Mary Photography

**District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026**

Vendor	Contact Name	Contact Email	Services Provided
Aaron Daffern Consulting	David Daffern	aarondaffern@gmail.com	Services include 1-day staff development for campus/district staff in several areas. 1) Student engagement: Attendees will explore the five facets of student motivation and learn how to leverage them for increased engagement and achievement. 2) Vocabulary instruction: Attendees will learn about the five parts of a powerful vocabulary program and how to use them to maximize literacy and content instruction. 3) Learning tasks that stick: Attendees will discover how encoding and recall affect learning and how learning tasks can be designed to be memorable. Other services include (virtual) executive, leadership, and instructional coaching.
Aha Education, LLC	Harvey Paneitz	jpaneitz@gmail.com	Aha Education, LLC provides drone and robotics curriculum, programming, afterschool, summer time, and competition
Alvarez Striping	Carlos Alvarez	alvarezstriping@yahoo.com	Parking lot striping, athletic fields, road striping, plus much more
Ameriturf (Scruggs Industries)	Michael Ratcliff	BRENRATCLIFF@COMCAST.NET	Distributor/manufacturer fertilizer, pesticides, seed
Be Well, Lead Well LLC	Natalie Fikac	bewellleadwell@gmail.com	Training, speaking, professional development, consultation and coaching
Betty Busby	Betty Busby	bettybusby@att.net	Council with students coded McKinney-Vento as homeless. Reach out to parents and students to ascertain needs, encourage attendance. Discuss post high school training options - connecting students with resources. Assist students with needs related to classes and passing.
Bilinguistics, Inc.	Maritza Jacobs	admin@bilinguistics.com	Professional Development for SLPs and educators. Professional Development for SLP's and educators and Speech and Language bilingual evaluations.
Cady Studios, LLC	Nicole Gregoric	sales@cadystudios.com	We are the premier high school photographer. Seniors, Underclass, Athletics, Etc. All things photography. We also offer branding (wall wraps, banners etc).

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

Vendor	Contact Name	Contact Email	Services Provided
Corwin Press, Inc	Sheila Lucier	sheila.lucier@corwin.com	<p>Corwin specializes in evidence-based professional learning aligned to district's objectives with a focus on Visible Learning, PLC+, Equity, distance learning, teacher clarity, literacy, math, coaching, and leadership. Our services are delivered virtually or onsite through a variety of formats: Keynotes kick off district-wide initiatives through highenergy, large-format events that introduce new concepts, create a shared vision of success, and drive motivation. Workshops provide educators opportunities to acquire and apply new knowledge by engaging, practicing, and modeling key concepts. Implementation Services such as curriculum meetings, guided classroom visits, data analysis, and leadership coaching allow consultants and educators to collaborate to put strategies into action. Coaching Services allow consultants to observe educators teaching in real time, , in the classroom setting. Educators receive targeted feedback, work through the planning and implementation process.</p>
Creative Mathematics (Kimberly Sutton)	Desiree Pierson	des@creativemathematics.com	Math: Professional Development for grade K-6 teachers. Face to Face instruction and Virtual training available
CRW Consulting, LLC	Christopher Webber	chris@crwconsulting.com	E-rate Consulting Services
DB3 Unlimited Services LLC	Denise Bromley	deniseb@db3unlimitedservices.com	<p>Proposed services are risk management/claims administration related for the school district. Industry Consultant Scope of Work: Risk Management and Claims Consulting. In relation to this proposal, wewould like to submit an offer of services for Workers Compensation and/or GL/AL claims auditing services, risk management consulting, claims oversight (assistance with services received from Texas Mutual Insurance), liability reviews, etc</p>

**District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026**

Vendor	Contact Name	Contact Email	Services Provided
DeltaMath Solutions Inc	Nicole Korzyk	orders@deltamath.com	We offer virtual staff/professional development in the usage of DeltaMath and DeltaMath PLUS. DeltaMath is an online math practice and learning site. Students will register with a teacher code and complete assignments made by their teacher. The paid product we offer is DeltaMath Plus, which is a yearly subscription and offers instructional videos, creation of online assessments and additional features. We offer individual teacher licenses as well as school and district site licenses for DeltaMath Plus. Our site licenses will include an admin portal which will allow for teacher onboarding and account oversight.
DPW Educational Consulting (Debra P Woolley)	Debra P Woolley	dpresley.woolley@gmail.com	Professional Development Services for Gifted and Talented training for teachers (foundation hours / update hours)
Dr. Yacovodonato Educational Consulting LLC	Pascual Yacovodonato	pyacovodonato@gmail.com	We offer professional development for teachers who serve second language learners including, but not limited to, Bilingual, English as a Second Language (ESL), Languages Other Than English (LOTE). In addition to professional development, the company offers coaching, job-embedded capacitation, and technical assistance on matters related to second language learners at the campus or district level.
Frontline Education (Frontline Technologies Group LLC)	Greg Doran	gdoran@frontlineed.com	Frontline Education is a leading provider of school administration software, empowering strategic K-12 leaders with the right tools, data, and insights to proactively manage human capital, business operations, student information, and special education. Educational organizations representing over 80,000 schools and millions of educators, administrators, and support personnel have partnered with Frontline Education in their efforts to develop the next generation of learners. With more than 22 years of experience serving the front line of education, Frontline Education provides actionable intelligence and insights benchmarked against national and state-specific trends that enable informed decisions and drive engagement across your school system. Frontline meets the unique needs of education for Business Operations, Human Capital Management, and Student Management. Our solutions are offered as a Software as a Service (SaaS).
Greasekleen Industries	Kyle Kluender	greasekleen@gmail.com	Kitchen Vent Hood Cleaning, pressure washing, or window cleaning services

**District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026**

Vendor	Contact Name	Contact Email	Services Provided
Interquest Group Inc. (Huber)	Marygrace Huber	gracehuber@interquestk9.com	Contraband Detection Services, Comfort Dog services Career Day Assemblies, red ribbon assemblies, contraband education assemblies
Josh Stumpfenhorst	Josh Stumpfenhorst	stumpteacher@gmail.com	Professional development for librarians.
Kristi Powitzky	Kristi Powitzky	kricketemail@yahoo.com	Curriculum developments and professional staff developments events district-wide.
Lifetouch NSS	Otis Hamlett	ohamlett@lifetouch.com	School Photography Services
Little Learners Literacy Academy	Delilah Gonzales	drdeegonzales@gmail.com	Range of early literacy professional development sessions.
Monsido	Taylor Rogers	tro@monsido.com	Website Accessibility, auditing, Q/A, ADA/WCAG, SEO, UPTIME, ANALYTICS AND ADD-ONS.
National Literacy Institute	Ingrid Haynes	ingridhaynesphd@gmail.com	Educational consulting and professional development in Literacy, Culturally Responsive Pedagogy, Digital Literacy/ Literacy and Technology Integration, Literacy Leadership, Curriculum and Literacy Site review.
New Teacher Center	Nichole Cooley	rfp@newteachercenter.org	New Teacher Center provides Pearland ISD's consulting and staff development with a focus on Instructional Coaching, Teacher Induction and Mentoring, Early Learning Coaching, and School Leadership Support. NTC has deep expertise with the TEKS from our work with multiple Texas districts supporting ELAR TEKS and curriculum aligned coaching. Our professional learning and job-embedded supports align with the revised English Language and Reading TEKS. As the new ELA TEKS require a greater focus on critical thinking skills and reading across non-fiction, NTC's curriculum coaching model provides the support teachers need to reconceptualize literacy development for all learners

**District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026**

Vendor	Contact Name	Contact Email	Services Provided
Nicki Booker LLC	nicki booker	nicki_booker@outlook.com	<p align="center">Staff Development in the areas of:</p> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> *Best Practices in Elementary Balanced Literacy Classrooms *TEKS-based Reading and Writing instruction and assessment *Early Literacy: Developmental stages of reading and writing <ul style="list-style-type: none"> *Guided Reading instruction and assessment *Intervention: instructional strategies for reading and writing <ul style="list-style-type: none"> *Early Childhood Best Practices <p align="center">Curriculum Development based on TEKS, stages of early literacy development, applications for small group intervention</p>
NOCTI	Amie Bloomfield	amie.bloomfield@nocti.org	NOCTI offers several services including badges, certification program management, custom development, online delivery, professional development, psychometric services, and reporting.
Pluralsight, LLC	Brooke Matsen	brooke-matsen@pluralsight.com	Saas-based technology skills development.
RC Health Services	Angela Adamo	angela@rhealthservices.com	Instructions pertaining to certifications as well as EMS-related content and certification
Rivet Education	Annie Morrison	annie.morrison@riveteducation.org	<p align="center">Consulting services in the area of instructional expertise that will support student success by providing guidance, training, mentoring, consulting, and other services related to high-quality instructional materials and professional learning in close partnership with the district administration, departments, and campuses. Specifically, Rivet can work to develop a strong academic vision; determine the extent to which the quality of instruction in classrooms aligns to that vision; identify and coach in the implementation of supports (e.g. instructional materials, professional learning) that educators need to deliver highquality instruction; and communicate with and invest key stakeholders.</p>
s3strategies, LLC	Sherry Owens	sherry.owens@s3strategies.net	Staff/professional development for K-12 educators: content specific or mixed audiences.
Sharron Helmke	Sharron Helmke	sharronhelmke@gmail.com	Single and multiple day professional learning experiences for teachers, teacher leaders, instructional coaches and specialists, and administrators

**District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026**

Vendor	Contact Name	Contact Email	Services Provided
Shielding Hearts (Susana Morell)	Susana Morell	susanamorell@shieldinghearts.org	Connecting people with the skills to transform their grief in healthy, sustainable ways and reduce the negative impacts of unprocessed trauma.
Shine Bright Tutoring (LPOH)	Stefany M. Thomas	stefanythomas@shinebrighttutoring.com	After school tutoring program
SPC of Texas	Jayson Stewart	spcoftexas@yahoo.com	Insect control for animals (FFA) or other.
StormGeo, Inc.	Megan Garcia	megan.garcia@stormgeo.com	24/7 weather support and meteorologist consultation including TropicsWatch (Tropical Weather Service), StormWatch (Severe Weather Service), Lightning Services (Lightning Proximity Alerts and Lightning Visualization) and Critical Temperature Advisories
The DDance Group, Inc.	Kelly Surina	kelly@theddancegroup.com	Leadership development services, including leadership retreats, leadership development, and strategic planning.
The Process Manager	Meliton Moya	moya@theprocessmanager.com	Professional Development for administrators, teachers and staff of all levels.
Think Behaviorally, PLLC	Aaron Gomez	aaron.gomez@thinkbehaviorally.com	ABA Services; Behavior Consultations; General Ed or Special Ed behavior support and professional development.
Thomas Educational Solutions	Benita Eileen Leon	ThomasEducationalSolutions@gmail.com	K-5 Science and K-6 General Teachers: Curriculum and Instruction Consulting, Professional/Staff Development, and Instructional Coaching Services
William and Mary Photography	Pete Wagner	petew_wam@yahoo.com	School Sports and Fine Arts Photography

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05

Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

1	If you are to be paid PER HOUR, please give your HOURLY RATE. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Hour. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID".			Minimum Hours	Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	If you will bill a minimum number of hours, please indicate the minimum number of hours you would bill the Department here:	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Alvarez Striping	\$250.00		none	
	Be Well, Lead Well LLC	\$750.00	\$750 per hour for training, speaking, professional development.	10	\$400-\$750 per hour
	Creative Mathematics (Kimberly Sutton)	\$600.00			Hourly rate is only applicable for Virtual Professional Development
	DB3 Unlimited Services LLC	\$95.00		Four (4) hours	Hourly rate of \$95.00 only pertains to the following services: Risk Management Consulting, Claims oversight and overview, project management services/tasks, and claims consulting
	DeltaMath Solutions Inc	\$300.00	Virtual training for teachers (up to 100 at a time) is available at a cost of \$300 per hour in 2- or 3-hour increments. We have also attached a pricing guide for the associated software licenses.	2	Rate is flat, \$300/hour
	Dr. Yacovodonato Educational Consulting LLC			3	\$900-\$3,000
	Interquest Group Inc. (Huber)	\$300.00		Our visits are provided in half-day and full-day increments. A half day cost is \$300. A full day cost is \$600.	

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05

Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

Rivet Education	\$250.00	The hourly rates for engaging Rivet Education staff are as follows and are inclusive of all taxes Rivet Education is required to pay: Consultant:\$250, Project Manager:\$150, Data Analyst:\$125, Communications Specialist: \$125	20	\$125-\$250
Shielding Hearts (Susana Morell)	\$100.00			
Think Behaviorally, PLLC	\$100.00	\$100.00/hr if contracted hourly.	1	\$100.00/hr if contracted hourly.
Thomas Educational Solutions	\$300.00		3 Hour Minimum	\$250 - \$300; Please see "Pricing Structure and Fees" attachment for additional details

2	If you are to be paid PER DAY, please give your DAILY RATE. If your services are not billed per day please click on "NO BID".			Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Alvarez Striping	\$1,850.00		none
	Be Well, Lead Well LLC	\$5,250.00	Cost is \$750 per hour for \$5,250 per day	\$4,500-\$5,250 per day
	Betty Busby	\$250.00		\$250/day
	Corwin Press, Inc	\$14,000.00	*prices range from \$5,500 to \$14,000 per day depending on service provided and consultant for onsite workshops. Virtual workshop prices range from \$5,000 to \$13,500, depending on service provided and consultant. Average price per workshop is \$7,000 Some PD services require resources at the cost to customer. These prices do not include presentations by John Hattie.	\$5,500 to \$14,000
	Creative Mathematics (Kimberly Sutton)	\$6,500.00		See Price Proposal Attachment
	DPW Educational Consulting (Debra P Woolley)	\$900.00		
	Dr. Yacovodonato Educational Consulting LLC			\$1,800-\$6,000

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

Interquest Group Inc. (Huber)	\$600.00		Our visits are provided in half-day and full-day increments. A half day cost is \$300. A full day cost is \$600.
Little Learners Literacy Academy	\$2,500.00		
National Literacy Institute	\$2,500.00		Consultants are paid by the day. For a full pricing ranges from \$2,500 to \$3,000 a day.
New Teacher Center	\$4,000.00	Please see the attached price proposal for complete details on NTC's pricing model.	
Nicki Booker LLC	\$1,200.00		Half-days at one half Daily Rate above.
s3strategies, LLC	\$3,500.00		\$3,000/ day if remote. \$3,500 if face to face training
Sharron Helmke	\$3,200.00		\$2,200 to \$3,800 per day of professional learning
The Process Manager	\$2,000.00		
Think Behaviorally, PLLC	\$700.00	\$700.00/day (8 consecutive hours). Days can also be split into half-days (4 consecutive hours), same rate if purchased and used as a full day (2 half-days on 2 separate occasions).	\$700.00/day (8 consecutive hours)
Thomas Educational Solutions	\$1,500.00		\$1200 - \$1500; Rate dependent upon type of training or service provided; Please see "Pricing Structure and Fees" attachment for additional details

3	If you are to be paid PER PARTICIPANT, please give your RATE PER PARTICIPANT. If your services are not billed per participant please click on "NO BID"	Rate Range
----------	---	-------------------

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
Aha Education, LLC		Additional cost, discounts, etc into the attached. There is also a training and support fee of \$2950.00 plus the option to upgrade or downgrade services.	
Be Well, Lead Well LLC	\$650.00	This is in alignment with the Dare to Lead Training - \$650 per person with a minimum of 20 participants	Dare to Lead Training - \$550-\$650 per person
Dr. Yacovodonato Educational Consulting LLC			\$300-\$1,000
Frontline Education (Frontline Technologies Group LLC)	\$21.00		IEP Is priced at \$21/Student, 504 Program management is priced at \$6.25/student
Interquest Group Inc. (Huber)	\$300.00		Our visits are provided in half-day and full-day increments PER TEAM. A half day cost is \$300 per team. A full day cost is \$600 per team.
Lifetouch NSS	\$14.99		\$14.99 thru \$54.99 for portrait packages.
NOCTI			\$9-\$42
Pluralsight, LLC	\$84.15		64 Elevate Licenses for \$84.15 each.
RC Health Services	\$75.00		Per person price of \$75.00 is based on a class size of 11-20 students.
s3strategies, LLC			Each workshop is designed for up to 50 participants
Shielding Hearts (Susana Morell)	\$50.00		
The DDance Group, Inc.	\$7,795.00		Varies by service - see attached

4	If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please give your PER EVENT RATE (Examples of this type of service may include, but not be limited to: speaker at In-service trainings, professional development events, session, etc.). If your services are not billed per Event please click on "NO BID".	Rate Range
----------	---	-------------------

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
Aaron Daffern Consulting	\$2,800.00		Prices for 1-day trainings and coaching. If trainings are conducted on-site, \$300 travel will be added to the cost for each day of training.
Be Well, Lead Well LLC	\$750.00		Paid per hour - \$750 per hour
Dr. Yacovodonato Educational Consulting LLC			\$1000-\$10,000
Interquest Group Inc. (Huber)	\$300.00		Our visits are provided in half-day and full-day increments. A half day cost is \$300. A full day cost is \$600.
Kristi Powitzky	\$750.00		\$450.00 - \$750.00
Little Learners Literacy Academy	\$2,500.00		
National Literacy Institute	\$129.00		129 to 189 per participant if attending an institute or academy
Nicki Booker LLC	\$1,200.00		Per Event Rate negotiable when event is less than a full-day.
Sharron Helmke	\$3,200.00		\$2200 to \$3800 per professional learning event
Shielding Hearts (Susana Morell)	\$550.00	\$550 dollars is the fee to facilitate a parent workshop. The workshop will include a workbook to support the "skillset" to be taught.	
The DDance Group, Inc.			Varies by service - see attached
The Process Manager	\$2,000.00	I will provide up to four (4) lectures a day for the \$2000.00 fee, which is my fee per day or per event if only one is scheduled for the day.	

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

Thomas Educational Solutions	\$1,550.00		\$1350 - 1550; Rate dependent upon type of training or service provided; Please see "Pricing Structure and Fees" attachment for additional details
------------------------------	------------	--	--

5	If you are to be paid LUMP SUM, please give your rate. If your services are not billed per LUMP SUM please click on "NO BID"			Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	CRW Consulting, LLC	\$4,250.00		\$4250 for filing Category 1 application, 3% of funded amount for Category 2 application
	DB3 Unlimited Services LLC	\$9,500.00	This flat rate is only for the claims auditing service. This flat fee includes 20 WC claims (indemnity and medical only) with final audit findings submitted in hardcopy and electronic format to the District. This fee also accounts for travel expenses for up to one onsite visit. If a request to audit additional files is made beyond the (20) proposed files, the additional files will be discounted to \$385.00 per audit. Liability Reviews vary based on specialty of the reviewer and inclusion of an affidavit. Prices vary between \$1050 - 1750.00 per referral.	40 claims audit includes up to two (2) onsite visits and all other deliverables noted in the previous supplier note = \$18,000.00

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

Frontline Education (Frontline Technologies Group LLC)	\$121,864.00		All Rates Included are for District wide access for services unlimited. Absence Management: \$36,683, Applicant Tracking: \$19,239, Frontline Central: \$17,590, Screening Assessments: \$8,245, Health Management: EHR & School Nursing: \$34,108, Special Education Goal Writer: \$2,500, Special Education Evaluation Writer: \$3,500
Greasekleen Industries	\$6,500.00		
Josh Stumpfenhorst	\$1,500.00		
Monsido	\$6,500.00	Monsido charges an annual subscription.	
National Literacy Institute	\$2,500.00		NLPDC normally is contracted for a year and paid after each sessions. Also, districts have paid one lump sum as well.
Shielding Hearts (Susana Morell)	\$9,000.00	\$9000 is the lump sum to cover services per semester.	
Think Behaviorally, PLLC	\$1,000.00	\$1,000 / Functional Behavior Assessment (FBA) (2-4 months to complete)	\$1,000 / Functional Behavior Assessment (FBA) (2-4 months to complete)

6	If you are to be paid PER SITE (LOCATION), please give your rate. If your services are not billed PER SITE please click on "NO BID".			Rate Range
	Supplier	Rate	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	Ameriturf (Scruggs Industries)	\$200.00	Consulting	\$100 to \$200 per job site delivery
	Interquest Group Inc. (Huber)	\$300.00		Our visits are provided in half-day and full-day increments regardless of the number of sites visited. A half day cost is \$300. A full day cost is \$600.
	National Literacy Institute	\$2,500.00		Response Attachments

District-Wide Contracted Services - RFP #21-0505-05
Contract Expiration - June 30, 2026

SPC of Texas	\$4,000.00	Rate is contingent on chemical consumption and nozzle tip replacement at the time of service per location	\$1,200- \$4,000
The DDance Group, Inc.	\$35,000.00		Varies by service - see attached