

**Pearland ISD Bid Recap**  
**District-wide Contracted Services**  
**RFP #20-0926-01**  
**January 15, 2020 – December 31, 2024**

A.I.R. Project  
AllPlayers Network Inc. (Rank One Sport)  
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)  
Benchmark Education Company LLC  
Bryant Mediation Group  
Champions Before & After School  
College Board  
Communication Axxess Ability Group (Hancock, Jahn, Lee & Puckett LLC)  
Cosenza & Associates, LLC  
Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.  
Del Alma Publications, LLC  
Eaglin Team Administrative Solutions  
Edgenuity Inc.  
Emergent Tree Education  
Forde-Ferrier, LLC  
Frog Street Press, LLC  
Girls Empowerment Network (GIRLS)  
Harris County Department of Education  
Houghton Mifflin Harcourt Publishing Company  
Houston A+ Challenge  
Houston Education Leadership Partners, LLC  
HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER BODY SHOP (SELECTTRANSPORTATION RESOURCES, LLC)  
iKids Inc.  
Infinite Gaming LLC  
Innovative Alternatives, Inc.  
Jon Riveira Pro Images  
Judy M. Wallis  
Kagan Professional Development  
Knowsys Educational Services, LLC  
LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS (Lakeshore Equipment Company)  
lead4ward, LLC  
Learn2Code.Live  
Learning Farm, LLC  
Little Birdies Mobile Golf Academy  
LittleScientists Inc. DBA Mad Science Of Houston  
Main Street Theater  
Masterword Services, Inc.  
Mentoring Minds, L.P.  
Michelle Swain (Susan Michelle Swain)  
MindRise Learning, LLC  
NOCTI

Noel Gray Consulting  
NuMinds Enrichment  
Paintings by Kathy (Julia K Hammond)  
Pearland Area Citizens Corps, Inc  
Performance Scoring  
Planting Seeds Tutoring  
Project Lead The Way, Inc.  
Public Consulting Group  
Recompete LLC  
Responsive Learning, LP  
Richard DePue  
RWL Group (Robert W. Lazarus & Associates, Inc.)  
s3strategies, LLC  
Sandra Mercuri  
Scholastic Inc.  
Seidlitz Education  
SkoolAide  
SMART Core Labs (Animation & Robotics For Kids)  
Snapology of Houston - South (Next Generation Education LLC)  
SPDF Kids  
Sports Media Publications (Dr David Davis)  
Teaching Strategies, LLC  
The DBQ Project (The DBQ Company)  
The Princeton Review (TPR Education LLC, d/b/a The Princeton Review)  
The University of Texas Health Science Center at Houston  
Tori Landis  
Valley Speech Language and Learning Center  
Walsh Gallegos Treviño Russo & Kyle P.C.  
Writers in the Schools  
Young Audiences of Houston (Young Audiences Inc., of Houston)

1	If you are to be paid PER HOUR, please give your HOURLY RATE. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Hour. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.						Minimum Hours	Rate Range	
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	If you will bill a minimum number of hours, please indicate the minimum number of hours you would bill the Department here:	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	A.I.R. Project	1	Hour		\$125.00	\$125.00			
	Bryant Mediation Group	1	Hour		\$218.75	\$218.75		4	8
	Communication Axxess Ability Group (Hancock, Jahn, Lee & Puckett LLC)	1	Hour		\$55.00	\$55.00		You will be charged 1 hour of travel which we apply towards your 2 hour minimum which applies per interpreter.	*Monday-Friday; 8am to 5pm; with 24 hour notice \$55.00 per hour.*Monday-Friday; 8am to 5pm; less than 24 hour notice \$75.00 per hour.*Monday-Friday; 5pm to 8am; with 24 hour notice \$75.00 per hour.*Monday-Friday; 5pm to 8am; less than 24 hour notice \$90.00 hour
	Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	1	Hour		\$100.00	\$100.00	Individual/family therapy services, along with training events are billed at the rate of \$100/hour. Group counseling services are billed at the rate of \$25/participant.	We project 20-30 hours/week.	We project \$1500-\$3000/week
	Del Alma Publications, LLC	1	Hour		\$150.00	\$150.00	Price is exclusive of travel and per diem. Travel is billed at \$200 / trip and per diem at \$120 / day.	1	
	Eaglin Team Administrative Solutions	1	Hour		\$60.00	\$60.00		4	20-60 per hour
	Frog Street Press, LLC	1	Hour		\$500.00	\$500.00	Frog street also conducts webinars. A one-hour webinar is available for \$500.00. A two-hour webinar is available for \$750.00. Cost of shipping any materials prior to webinar is not included in pricing.		
	Girls Empowerment Network (GIRLS)	1	Hour		\$400.00	\$400.00		A minimum of 1 hour	\$85-\$400 depending on services selected, per campus
	Harris County Department of Education	1	Hour		\$250.00	\$250.00		The minimum number of hours HCDE will bill Pearland ISD is four (4) hours. Please see HCDE's CSSS TLC and Therapy's Scope of Work_Costs uploaded.	The HOURLY RATE range is: \$200 / hr. – \$250 / hr.
	HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER BODY SHOP (SELECTTRANSPORTATION RESOURCES, LLC)	1	Hour		\$85.00	\$85.00		1.0 FLAT RATE	85.00
	Innovative Alternatives, Inc.	1	Hour		\$150.00	\$150.00		No minimum	\$75-\$350/hr
	Judy M. Wallis	1	Hour		No Bid			3 hours	1000
	Little Birdies Mobile Golf Academy	1	Hour		\$128.00	\$128.00		This is in conjunction with our per participant rate. A minimum of \$125. per hour if the minimum participants 8 students is not met.	
	LittleScientists Inc. DBA Mad Science Of Houston	1	Hour		\$375.00	\$375.00	Price depends on the program that is booked by the school (After School Programs . Special events , Workshops , Science Day/Night Booths )	1 hr	\$375
	Masterword Services, Inc.	1	Hour		\$71.95	\$71.95		Spoken Language: 2 hour minimum; ASL Interpreting Services 1 Hour minimum plus 1.5 Administrative fee	Please see alternative Pricing Proposal Form
	Michelle Swain (Susan Michelle Swain)	1	Hour		\$300.00	\$300.00			
	MindRise Learning, LLC	1	Hour		\$13.25	\$13.25		MindRise does not have a minimum number of hours	Hourly pricing ranges from \$8.00 to \$13.25 per student session, based on total number of students and days.
	NuMinds Enrichment	1	Hour		\$500.00	\$500.00		Minimum 4 hours	2,000 - 20,000
	Planting Seeds Tutoring	1	Hour		\$50.00	\$50.00			

RWL Group (Robert W. Lazarus & Associates, Inc.)	1	Hour		\$320.00	\$320.00	It's not possible to estimate the minimum number of hours without knowing more about your insurance program in place.	n/a	\$320/\$325 Hourly Rate
Sandra Mercuri	1	Hour		\$500.00	\$500.00		2	N/A
Snapology of Houston - South (Next Generation Education LLC)	1	Hour		\$225.00	\$225.00		1-2 hours	\$175-225.00
SPDF Kids	1	Hour		\$120.00	\$120.00		3 hrs.	
The Princeton Review (TPR Education LLC, d/b/a The Princeton Review)	1	Hour		\$40.00	\$40.00		100 hours	
Tori Landis	1	Hour		\$200.00	\$200.00			
Walsh Gallegos Treviño Russo & Kyle P.C.	1	Hour		\$315.00	\$315.00			Shareholders: \$315/hr, Associates licensed 2 or more years: \$295/hr, Associates licensed 1-2 yrs: \$240/hr, Associates licensed less than 1 year: \$230/hr, Paralegals & Law Clerks: \$125/hr
Writers in the Schools	1	Hour		\$400.00	\$400.00		no minimum	\$400-\$2,400
Young Audiences of Houston (Young Audiences Inc., of Houston)	1	Hour		\$125.00	\$125.00		No minimum hours required.	\$95-\$370

<b>2</b>	<p><b>If you are to be paid PER DAY, please give your DAILY RATE. If your services are not billed per day please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on the "Response Attachments" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Day. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</b></p>						<b>Rate Range</b>
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Estimated</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Please specify here the range of pricing:</b>
Benchmark Education Company LLC	1	Day		\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00		Fee is per day, per consultant. Please see attached Professional Development Pricing document.
Bryant Mediation Group	1	Day		\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00		3500-4000
College Board	1	Day		No Bid			Please see attachments for pricing information!
Cosenza & Associates, LLC	1	Day		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	Daily rate is inclusive of travel expenses. For professional development that occurs over multiple consecutive days, the first day will be \$2000 and additional days \$1500 each.	1500-2000
Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	1	Day		No Bid			We project no more than quarterly day long training sessions; \$3000.00
Del Alma Publications, LLC	1	Day		\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	Price is exclusive of travel and per diem. Travel is billed at \$200 / trip and per diem at \$120 / day.	
Eaglin Team Administrative Solutions	1	Day		\$480.00	\$480.00	max for 1 class with up to 40 attendees	200-480 per day for class session

						The daily rate reflects the purchase of one (1) onsite professional development day to support the implementation of Edgenuity content / courseware and supplemental / intervention products. Edgenuity's professional development is specific for teaching teachers, administrators, and applicable staff members how to utilize the Edgenuity platform. Professional development to support the implementation of ELL and social-emotional learning content is priced separately. Additional pricing information – to include options for virtual (webinar) training and bundled options for discounted onsite professional development – can be found in the attached price list and/or by contacting the Account Executive.	Volume discounts are available. For more information, please see Pearland ISD Price List included in the Response Attachments tab.
Edgenuity Inc.	1	Day		\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00		
Forde-Ferrier, LLC	1	Day		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00		
						Face to face training - Session Duration: 3 - 6 hours, \$2,750, inclusive of travel, etc. 50 Participant maximum - 1 trainer. Additional pricing is available for multiple days and multiple trainers. Classroom Coaching is available for \$3,500 per day, 3 day minimum, inclusive of travel, etc. Customized training is available (pricing available upon request).	\$2750.00 - \$3500.00 Per day depending on whether the training is standard or customized.
Frog Street Press, LLC	1	Day		\$2,750.00	\$2,750.00		
							The DAILY RATE varies depending on the service provided. Please see HCDE's CSSS TLC and Therapy's Scope of Work_Costs uploaded. The DAILY RATE range is: \$380 – \$4,800.
Harris County Department of Education	1	Day		\$4,800.00	\$4,800.00		
							Houghton Mifflin Harcourt offers a sliding scale of costs for professional development services for in-person courses and coaching based on the number of days delivered. Pricing for keynote presentations varies per speaker; pricing for our HMH Family Engagement services requires both services and materials; webinars, in-person coaching, and virtual coaching are also available upon request. For further pricing information, please refer to the Price Proposal information included in our response. HMH will be happy to work with you to provide group discounts as applicable.
Houghton Mifflin Harcourt Publishing Company	1	Day		\$4,050.00	\$4,050.00		
Innovative Alternatives, Inc.	1	Day		\$950.00	\$950.00		
Judy M. Wallis	1	Day		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00		2000 a day
Knowsys Educational Services, LLC	1	Day		\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00		\$3500 (1-50 participants), \$4500 (51-100 participants), \$5500 (101-150 participants)
							Lakeshore offers our Professional Development Services on "Half-Day" or "Full-Day" rates. Half-Day rate (up to 3 consecutive hours): \$2,500 and Full-Day rate (3-6 hours): \$3,500. Prices for Professional Development Services are good through the first year of the initial contract term, and is subject to change on an annual basis.
LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS (Lakeshore Equipment Company)	1	Day		\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00		

lead4ward, LLC	1	Day		\$7,900.00	\$7,900.00	lead4ward professional development services pricing varies by training and/or service type and number of participants. \$7,900 is our daily rate for a professional development "Leadership" training for up to 300 participants. For a list of our services, resources and pricing options, see the attached "fees for services" document or visit www.lead4ward.com. Detailed quotes can also be provided as needed.	See attached
Learn2Code.Live	1	Day		\$250.00	\$250.00		
LittleScientists Inc. DBA Mad Science Of Houston	1	Day		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	Price depends on the program that is booked by the school (After School Programs . Special events , Workshops , Science Day/Night Booths )	3000
Mentoring Minds, L.P.	1	Day		\$3,600.00	\$3,600.00	On an average, 1 day (6 hours) training of up to 75 people with one consultant/presenter, cost would be \$3,600. On an average, one-half day (3 hours) training of up to 75 people with one consultant/presenter, cost would be \$2,800. Includes training, course material handouts up to 75 participants, travel and expenses. Does not include support materials.	1 day (6 hours) training of up to 75 people with one consultant/presenter, cost would be \$3,600. One-half day (3 hours) training of up to 75 people with one consultant/presenter, cost would be \$2,800.
Michelle Swain (Susan Michelle Swain)	1	Day		\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00		
NOCTI	1	Day		\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00		\$1,500 per day plus travel expenses
Noel Gray Consulting	1	Day		\$1,350.00	\$1,350.00		Full day-1350.00 & half day \$675.00
NuMinds Enrichment	1	Day		\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00		4,000 - 20,000
Pearland Area Citizens Corps, Inc	1	Day		\$100.00	\$100.00		\$100 for each ADDITIONAL Instructor/per day (NOTE: if training can be conducted in a manner that allows a 10:1 ratio, the 1st instructor is included in the "per Participant" rate)
Richard DePue	1	Day		\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	If your school was to host a welding workshop, it would be about \$1500 per day.	
s3strategies, LLC	1	Day		\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00	Our pricing is CONFIDENTIAL	CONFIDENTIAL: \$3500 for the first day, \$3000 for each consecutive additional day
Sandra Mercuri	1	Day		\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00		N/A
Scholastic Inc.	1	Day		\$3,999.00	\$3,999.00	Please see the attached Scholastic Professional Learning Services Price Schedule for Literacy Development, Learning Supports, and Family and Community Engagement courses, coaching, and other services. Courses and sessions are held at a District site. Availability of services is subject to change.	\$1,899-\$3,999
Seidlitz Education	1	Day		\$4,600.00	\$4,600.00	For John Seidlitz - \$4,000-\$4,600/per day (all travel expenses included)For ALL other Seidlitz Education trainers - \$3,000-\$3,500/per day (all travel expenses included)Trainings may not exceed 130 participants without prior arrangement with Kathy Belanger – 210.315.7119POs for trainings & books accompanying a training are due no later than 30 days prior to training date. Payment is Net30 from date of service or shipping date.	For John Seidlitz - \$4,000-\$4,600/per day (all travel expenses included) For ALL other Seidlitz Education trainers - \$3,000-\$3,500/per day (all travel expenses included)
Snapology of Houston - South (Next Generation Education LLC)	1	Day		\$425.00	\$425.00	This amount is based on two hours of teaching.	See pricing sheet
SPDF Kids	1	Day		\$960.00	\$960.00		

Teaching Strategies, LLC	1	Day		\$3,300.00	\$3,300.00	Our company provides basic training for free, but in depth training is offered at a daily rate. Please see attached "Teaching Strategies' Professional Development Pricing" document in the Response Attachments Tab of this response.
The DBQ Project (The DBQ Company)	1	Day		\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	
Valley Speech Language and Learning Center	1	Day		\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	Please see attached compensation schedule for prices, duration, necessary materials and targeted audience.
Walsh Gallegos Treviño Russo & Kyle P.C.	1	Day		\$4,250.00	\$4,250.00	See attached fee schedule for Inservice Rates
Writers in the Schools	1	Day		\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00	\$1,200-2,400

<b>3</b>	<p><b>If you are to be paid PER PARTICIPANT, please give your RATE PER PARTICIPANT. If your services are not billed per participant please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Response Attachments" tab.(Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Participant. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</b></p>						<b>Rate Range</b>
----------	---	--	--	--	--	--	-------------------

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
A.I.R. Project	1	Per Person		\$125.00	\$125.00		
Art & Kustom Kreations (AKK Services, LLC)	1	Per Person		\$136.50	\$136.50	Price proposal attached in Response Attachments. Rate provided is for a 14 week session. A 15% discount will be applied to schools committing to two semesters. A 10% discount will be applied to schools committing to a minimum of 10 students per semester.	12 week program: \$108-\$117 14 week program: \$126-\$136.50 (per student)
Bryant Mediation Group	1	Per Person		\$1,750.00	\$1,750.00		875-1750
Champions Before & After School	1	Per Person		\$85.50	\$85.50		Champions will charge tuition directly to families weekly, per participant attending our programs. Weekly tuition varies based on part-time or full-time attendance: 1-2 days per week: \$18 Before, \$30 After, \$43 Combined Before & After. 3 days per week: \$25 Before, \$42 After, \$60 Combined Before & After. 4-5 days per week: \$35 Before, \$60 After, \$85.50 Combined Before & After. We also offer a 10% discount for: School District Employees, Military, Multi-Child, and Combined Before & After (this last discount can be combined with other discounts). The pricing is provided to Pearland ISD, for the 2019-2020 school year. Pricing for other districts may vary by geographic locations and from year-to-year. See also our Price Proposal under "Response Attachments."
Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	1	Per Person		\$25.00	\$25.00	Group counseling sessions are billed at \$25/participant with a minimum of 4 participants/group.	\$200-\$1250
Eaglin Team Administrative Solutions	1	Per Person		\$480.00	\$480.00		480 per person, per participant
Girls Empowerment Network (GIRLS)	1	Per Person		\$400.00	\$400.00		\$85-\$400 depending on services selected, per campus
Harris County Department of Education	1	Per Person		\$495.00	\$495.00		The RATE PER PARTICIPANT varies depending on the workshop or training. Please see HCDE's CSSS TLC and Therapy's Scope of Work_Costs uploaded. The RATE PER PARTICIPANT range is: \$55 – \$495.

Houston Education Leadership Partners, LLC	1	Per Person		\$8,800.00	\$8,800.00	Professional development services are delivered over a nine-month period of time. The services are provided as a program and billed at a per participant program rate. There is no hourly rate as this is part of the total package. This is the cost for the total delivery of professional development services per participant delivered at Rice University from October 2019 through June 2020 through our Executive Education Academy in partnership with the Jones Business School. Participants include campus and/or district leaders. A sample calendar is attached in this proposal under the Response Attachments tab.	
iKids Inc.	1	Per Person		\$65.00	\$65.00		\$65 to \$95 per month, program pricing varies based on selections and days of participation
Innovative Alternatives, Inc.	1	Per Person		\$100.00	\$100.00		\$25-150 per participant depending upon training
Jon Riveira Pro Images	1	Per Person		\$75.00	\$75.00		For banners, price varies per banner dependant on size and artwork of banners. Standard banners start at \$75 per banner/single player. Multi player/class banners are more
Kagan Professional Development	1	Per Person		\$649.00	\$649.00		\$199-\$649 *Please see attached pricing structure '2019 District and School Fee'
Learn2Code.Live	1	Per Person		\$240.00	\$240.00	Afterschool programs are offered at \$20 per class. 12 class long afterschool program costs \$240 per participant (CONFIDENTIAL)	
Learning Farm, LLC	1	Per Person		\$6.00	\$6.00		\$6/per student (all subjects includes). Rate drops as more licenses are ordered.
Little Birdies Mobile Golf Academy	1	Per Person		\$16.00	\$16.00		Our minimum class number is 8 students and our max is 15 students per class per day per campus.
LittleScientists Inc. DBA Mad Science Of Houston	1	Per Person		\$50.00	\$50.00	Price depends on the program that is booked by the school (After School Programs . Special events , Workshops , Science Day/Night Booths )	50
Pearland Area Citizens Corps, Inc	1	Per Person		\$45.00	\$45.00	This would include a participant needing the highest level of CPR/AED/FA certification.	\$30 to \$45 depending on certification level
Performance Scoring	1	Per Person		\$2.99	\$2.99		Performance Scoring is a monthly subscription service starting at \$2.99 per user for 1-99 users. Larger volume and multi-year discount opportunities are available for discounts up to 75%. See pricing table is "Response Attachments" tab for more information.
Project Lead The Way, Inc.	1	Per Person		\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00	Please see uploaded pricing document for details on pricing for every PLTW PD course	
Recompete LLC	1	Per Person		\$2.00	\$2.00	We are a new company that is willing to work with your school district and have all of your students and administrators use the software at a reduced rate. We are willing to give it for free for one year as a pilot. We just want the opportunity to work with Pearlman ISD.	Recompete as a company would like opportunity to partner with Pearlman ISD and is very flexible on the pricing.



Responsive Learning, LP	1	Per Person		\$395.00	\$395.00	Responsive Learning, LP provides online professional development training for administrators and teachers which includes gifted and talented, T-TESS, and PD to Practice. Pricing is based on the per teacher cost of training, the courses selected, and the number of teachers being trained. The per person cost of 395.00 is the per teacher cost for the 30-hour G/T package. The Responsive Learning catalog of online professional development courses including pricing is included in the Requested Attachments.	Pricing is based on the per teacher cost of training, the courses selected, and number of teachers being trained. The Responsive Learning catalog of online professional development courses including pricing is included in the Requested Attachments.
Richard DePue	1	Per Person		\$20.00	\$20.00	The price is \$20 per student certification that is given.	
SkoolAide	1	Per Person		\$8.00	\$8.00	We charge for use of the platform at \$8.00/student/year. Students can use the program across the summer as well, with the new year starting at the beginning of the school year.	
SMART Core Labs (Animation & Robotics For Kids)	1	Per Person		\$24.00	\$24.00	Pricing Structure attached under "Response Attachments". Pricing based on volume of participants and duration of services	\$8.00 - \$24.00
Snapology of Houston - South (Next Generation Education LLC)	1	Per Person		\$24.00	\$24.00		
The Princeton Review (TPR Education LLC, d/b/a The Princeton Review)	1	Per Person		\$1,800.00	\$1,800.00		\$1,800 - \$1,500
The University of Texas Health Science Center at Houston	1	Per Person		\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00		20.00 per student session with a minimum of 60 sessions per participant (1200).
Walsh Gallegos Treviño Russo & Kyle P.C.	1	Per Person		\$175.00	\$175.00		Annual HR Symposiums are priced per participant. Send up to 3 participants for \$175 per District, then each additional participant is \$65.

<b>4</b>	<p><b>If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please give your PER EVENT RATE (Examples of this type of service may include, but not be limited to: speaker at In-service trainings, professional development events, session, etc.). If your services are not billed per Event please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Response Attachments" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Event. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</b></p>	<b>Rate Range</b>
----------	---	-------------------

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
A.I.R. Project	1	Event		\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00		
Bryant Mediation Group	1	Event		\$500.00	\$500.00		
Counseling Connections for Change, Inc.	1	Event		\$750.00	\$750.00		For 6-8 hours of professional training, we bill at the rate of \$750/day.
Del Alma Publications, LLC	1	Event		\$200.00	\$200.00	This is the price for author visit to school per presentation and includes a classroom book set of 25 books (23 paperbacks and 2 hardcover), excluding travel. For two presentations in one day at one school the price is \$350, excluding travel and includes 50 paperback books. Travel is billed at \$200 / trip.	\$200 - \$350
Eaglin Team Administrative Solutions	1	Event		\$400.00	\$400.00		200-400 per event if a class, 10-40 attendees

Frog Street Press, LLC	1	Event		\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00	\$3,500, inclusive of travel, etc. 50 Participant maximum - 1 trainer. Additional pricing is available for multiple days and multiple trainers. Classroom Coaching is available for \$3,500 per day, 3 day minimum, inclusive of travel, etc. Services for General Education:Frog Street is an Early Childhood Education Publisher with a full Continuum of Curriculum, Birth to Five Years. Frog Street offers age-specific professional learning experiences for teachers, administrators, families and coaches. These comprehensive, impactful trainings are intended to improve climate, culture, and outcomes for teachers — they will bring the joy of teaching back into the classroom! Choose from a variety of sessions to fit your needs, or contact us to learn more about having Frog Street build a customized training session for your group!Services for Career and Technology:Frog Street's AIM Observational Assessment is a teacher-friendly online platform designed to document and monitor a child's progress toward reaching benchmarks and key indicators for kindergarten readiness. It is a turnkey solution that provides continuous monitoring tools, differentiated instructional strategies and activities, and online guided support – all in one easy-to-navigate, reliable system. The AIM Observational Assessment tool can be used with the AIM Criterion-	\$3500.00 to \$5000.00 per day depending whether the event is a classroom coaching, customize training or a Keynote/Motivational Speaker.
Harris County Department of Education	1	Event		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00		The PER EVENT RATE varies depending on the services provided. Please see HCDE's CSSS TLC and Therapy's Scope of Work_Costs uploaded. The PER EVENT RATE range is: \$1,600 – \$2,000.
Infinite Gaming LLC	1	Event		\$300.00	\$300.00	\$300 for the first two hours and then \$100 for every additional hour wanted per event paid via check prior to the event or the day of the event.	\$300 for the first two hours and then \$100 for every additional hour wanted per event paid via check prior to the event or the day of the event.
Innovative Alternatives, Inc.	1	Event		\$2,800.00	\$2,800.00		Multicultural Mediations as Experiential Diversity Training Range from \$700 for 2 hrs to \$2800 for 8 hr events. 4 facilitators required for break-out groups
Jon Riveira Pro Images	1	Event		\$125.00	\$125.00	Action Shots of games are negotiable	
Judy M. Wallis	1	Event		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00		1000-2000
Kagan Professional Development	1	Event		\$3,999.00	\$3,999.00		2,499-3,999 + Travel fee and Course Materials *Please see attached pricing structure '2019 District and School Fee'
Learn2Code.Live	1	Event		\$2,588.00	\$2,588.00	Coding classes offered to students during school hours. The courses are offered over the period of a quarter with 1 day of instruction per week. (7 hours of instruction per day) including curriculum cost. The cost breakup is as follows: (1) Cost of instruction per day (7 hours) = \$252; (2) Cost of curriculum per grade level = \$80/month (CONFIDENTIAL)	
LittleScientists Inc. DBA Mad Science Of Houston	1	Event		\$500.00	\$500.00	Price depends on the program that is booked by the school (After School Programs . Special events , Workshops , Science Day/Night Booths )	500
Main Street Theater	1	Event		\$1,650.00	\$1,650.00		\$215-\$1650

Scholastic Inc.	1	Event		\$999.00	\$999.00	Scholastic provides 90-minute Professional Learning Interactive Webinars, as well as Virtual Coaching. Please see attached Price Schedule for details.	\$799-\$999
Seidlitz Education	1	Event		\$4,600.00	\$4,600.00		For John Seidlitz - \$4,000-\$4,600/per day (all travel expenses included) For ALL other Seidlitz Education trainers - \$3,000-\$3,500/per day (all travel expenses included)
The Princeton Review (TPR Education LLC, d/b/a The Princeton Review)	1	Event		\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00		
Walsh Gallegos Treviño Russo & Kyle P.C.	1	Event		\$6,300.00	\$6,300.00		See attached fee schedule for Inservice Rates. Price above is for Toolbox Workshops, and is priced per event and includes up to 40 participants.
Young Audiences of Houston (Young Audiences Inc., of Houston)	1	Event		\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00		\$200-\$1,200

<b>5</b>	<p><b>If you are to be paid LUMP SUM, please give your rate. If your services are not billed per LUMP SUM please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Line Items" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Lump Sum. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</b></p>						<b>Rate Range</b>
----------	---	--	--	--	--	--	-------------------

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
Eaglin Team Administrative Solutions	1	Lump Sum		\$1,600.00	\$1,600.00	discounted to school 400.00	1600 would be an estimate max per Lum Sum
Emergent Tree Education	1	Lump Sum		\$600.00	\$600.00		600-9,000 (can be customized based on number of campuses and training selected)
Girls Empowerment Network (GIRLS)	1	Lump Sum		\$8,000.00	\$8,000.00		\$800-\$8000 depending on services selected, per campus
Harris County Department of Education	1	Lump Sum		\$4,250.00	\$4,250.00		The LUMP SUM RATE varies depending on the services provided. Please see HCDE's CSSS TLC and Therapy's Scope of Work_Costs uploaded. The LUMP SUM rate range is: \$1,700 – \$4,250.
Infinite Gaming LLC	1	Lump Sum		No Bid		\$300 for the first two hours and then \$100 for every additional hour wanted per event paid via check prior to the event or the day of the event.	
Judy M. Wallis	1	Lump Sum		No Bid			1000-2000
Learning Farm, LLC	1	Lump Sum		\$6.00	\$6.00		\$6/per student (all subjects includes). Rate drops as more licenses are ordered.
LittleScientists Inc. DBA Mad Science Of Houston	1	Lump Sum		\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	Price depends on the program that is booked by the school (After School Programs . Special events , Workshops , Science Day/Night Booths )	10000
Sports Media Publicationss (Dr David Davis)	1	Lump Sum		\$1,008.33	\$1,008.33	\$1,008.33 is agreed amount per month by Pearland ISD Athletic Department	
The Princeton Review (TPR Education LLC, d/b/a The Princeton Review)	1	Lump Sum		\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00		3,000 - \$12,000
Writers in the Schools	1	Lump Sum		\$8,000.00	\$8,000.00		\$5,000-\$8,000

<b>6</b>	<p><b>If you are to be paid PER SITE (LOCATION), please give your rate. If your services are not billed PER SITE please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Line Items" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Location. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</b></p>						<b>Rate Range</b>
----------	--	--	--	--	--	--	-------------------

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
A.I.R. Project	1	Per Site		\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00		10,000 (elementary and middle school)-15,000 (high school)
AllPlayers Network Inc. (Rank One Sport)	1	Per Site		\$600.00	\$600.00		Price varies - could be more or less than \$600
Bryant Mediation Group	1	Per Site		\$100.00	\$100.00		100-200
Eaglin Team Administrative Solutions	1	Per Site		\$400.00	\$400.00		max up 4 locations same as per event
Harris County Department of Education	1	Per Site		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00		The rate PER SITE (LOCATION) depends on the services provided. Please see HCDE's CSSS TLC and Therapy's Scope of Work_Costs uploaded. The PER SITE (LOCATION) rate range is: \$1,600 – \$2,000.
Judy M. Wallis	1	Per Site		No Bid			1000-2000
Learning Farm, LLC	1	Per Site		\$6.00	\$6.00		\$6/per student (all subjects includes). Rate drops as more licenses are ordered.
Little Birdies Mobile Golf Academy	1	Per Site		\$128.00	\$128.00		Our rates are on a per site basis, per participant or per hour.
LittleScientists Inc. DBA Mad Science Of Houston	1	Per Site		\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	Price depends on the program that is booked by the school (After School Programs . Special events , Workshops , Science Day/Night Booths )	20000
Paintings by Kathy (Julia K Hammond)	1	Per Site		\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00		I typically give a 'not to exceed' bid to each job. If you need a more specific price guide Pasadena isd requires a price per sq. Ft. Guide which is \$8-\$16-\$24 per sq.ft. All dependent on difficulty, detail or location (requiring scaffolding, exterior, etc)
Walsh Gallegos Treviño Russo & Kyle P.C.	1	Per Site		\$250.00	\$250.00		See attached fee schedule. Audio Conferences are \$250 per District (site license)