

Special Programs Contracted Services
RFP #19-0411-03
Approved Vendors

A.I.R. Project
Abilities Therapy and Consulting, LLC
Accountable Healthcare Staffing
Alliance For Multicultural Community Service DBA The Alliance
Apple of His Eyes Learning Center
Ardor Health Solutions (All Source Recruiting Group, Inc.)
Avondale House
Brazoria County Counseling Center, Inc
CARE, LLC (COLLABORATIVE AUTISM RESOURCES & EDUCATION (CARE), LLC)
Carr Speech Therapy Services, PLLC (Isaac)
Clinical Communications, LP
Cobb Pediatric Therapy Services
Contract Resource Group
EDUPROJECT ELL, LLC
Estrellita
Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC
Expanding Expression LLC (Sara Smith)
Gary & Lana Life Saving Skills
Gulf Coast Therapy Houston
Harris County Department of Education
Invo Healthcare Associates
Julia Strait
Kelley W Hawkins
Kids Vocabulary
Kristin Streich
LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS (Lakeshore Equipment Company)
Learning Without Tears (No Tears Learning Inc)
LNC Consulting & Associates, LLC
Masterword Services, Inc.
Mediscan Staffing Services
MedPerm Placement Inc., dba Therapy Consultants
n2y, LLC
Pinwheel Therapy
Providential Counseling & Consulting Services, PLLC
RiverKids Pediatric Home Health
Rohrer Resources
Shiloh Treatment Center (Shiloh Treatment Center, Inc.)
Social Thinking (Think Social Publishing, Inc.)
Soliant Health
Specialized Assessment & Consulting, LLC
Stuttering Therapy Resources, Inc. (Stuttering Therapy Resources)

Sunbelt Staffing
The Execu|Search Group (Execu|Search Holdings)
The Master Teacher
The University of Texas Health Science Center at Houston
TherapyTravelers LLC
Valley Speech Language and Learning Center
Ventris Learning LLC
Wingard Therapy Associates

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

<p>1 If you are to be paid PER HOUR, please give your HOURLY RATE. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Hour. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per hour please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</p>						Minimum Hours	Rate Range
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	If you will bill a minimum number of hours, please indicate the minimum number of hours you would bill the Department here:	Please specify here the range of pricing:
A.I.R. Project	1	Hour	\$100.00	\$100.00		200	\$50-\$100
Abilities Therapy and Consulting, LLC	1	Hour	\$125.00	\$125.00			Our hourly rates range from \$55-\$125 depending on the service selected. Complete Price Proposal is uploaded under the Response Attachments Tab.
Accountable Healthcare Staffing	1	Hour	\$72.00	\$72.00	Rates and services provided in Response Attachments	No minimum hours requirement	Please see rate sheet in Response Attachments tab
Alliance For Multicultural Community Service DBA The Alliance	1	Hour	\$60.00	\$60.00		Minimum 2 hours.	1. On-site interpretation, scheduled 24 hours in advance, will be billed at a rate of \$60.00.00 per hour. Please see attached service agreement for pricing.

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

Apple of His Eyes Learning Center	1	Hour	\$120.00	\$120.00		2 hours	\$120-\$150/hour.
					<p>Payment is structured by the hour, with a rate according to the specialty, cost of living, location, rates of similar contracts and the candidates' level of experience. Hourly rates include costs associated with payment of salaries and benefits, and travel expenses of all contracted employees at no additional charge to the district. Hourly rates also include all services such as treatment, evaluation, consultations, meetings and documentation. As a district partner, you will enjoy all our staffing services at NO CHARGE to the district. Our healthcare professionals will provide direct services to the students based on the ARD/IEP, planning, consultation, training, assessment, and evaluations. They will also attend parent conferences, participate in meetings, complete the required paperwork, and follow all procedures outlined by the Special Education Department. We provide our school districts with affordable rates for highly qualified professionals who are available from a full year to a short-term coverage. If there are temporary maternity leaves, FMLA, vacation coverages, or resignations, we have you covered. If you have immediate needs, we should be your first call. Most of our candidates are interested in entertaining full-time positions from 30 to 40 hours per week. The maximum contract hours worked by our contracted employees are 40 hours per week. No time over 40 hours per week will be billed without prior approval from the Director of Special Education and Supervisor. Mileage Rate reimbursement on the same day only between school sites and to the student's home if applicable by the District.</p>		
Ardor Health Solutions (All Source Recruiting Group, Inc.)	1	Hour	\$64.00	\$64.00		20	

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

					<p>Counseling Services District to pay \$75 per hour for LPC Services District to pay \$50 per hour for LPC-Intern Services Insurance to be billed when appropriate (This will reduce district's reimbursement) Psychiatric Services District to pay \$300 for initial evaluation District to pay \$75 per follow up appointment Insurance to be billed when appropriate (This will reduce district's reimbursement) Continuing Education training and CEU offerings One hour \$200 Two hours \$400 Four hours \$700 Psychological testing services Psycho-educational Evaluation - Initial Evaluation (LD) \$1,150 Psychological testing services Psycho-educational Evaluation - Initial Evaluation (LD) \$1,150 Bilingual evaluations Add \$550 to base fee Psychological Evaluation - Initial (ED) \$1,150 Psychological Evaluation - Initial (OHI)/ADHD \$1,150 Psychological Evaluation - Initial (Autism) \$1,950 Psychological Re-evaluation (ED, OHI, Autism) \$1,150 Psycho-educational Re-evaluation (ID, LD) \$1,150 Functional Behavior Assessment and Behavior Evaluation Plans \$1,150 Review of Existing Evaluation Data \$350 Independent Educational Evaluation \$3,550 Hourly rate for ARD's, consultation, internal audits \$250 1st hour/\$200 each additional hour</p>		<p>Counseling Services - District to pay: \$75 per hour for LPC Service District to pay: \$50 per hour for LPC-Intern Services Psychiatric Services - District to pay: \$300 for initial evaluation District to pay \$75 per follow up appointment Psychological testing services Psycho-educational Evaluation - Initial Evaluation (LD) \$1,150 Psychological testing services Psycho-educational Evaluation - Initial Evaluation (LD) \$1,150 Bilingual evaluations Independent Educational Evaluation: \$3,550.</p>
Brazoria County Counseling Center, Inc	1	Hour	\$100.00	\$100.00		N/A	
CARE, LLC (COLLABORATIVE AUTISM RESOURCES & EDUCATION (CARE), LLC)	1	Hour	\$150.00	\$150.00	Rate per hour to conduct a IEE -FBA or BIP, typically FBA - 8-10 hours, BIP - 8-10 hours. Rate per hour to conduct FBA or BIP for specific student - typically 8-10 hours for each portion.		
Carr Speech Therapy Services, PLLC (Isaac)	1	Hour	\$65.00	\$65.00		two hours minimum	65.00-75.00 per hour
Clinical Communications, LP	1	Hour	\$78.00	\$78.00	Range in hourly rate determined by the experience and skill-set (i.e. bilingual rate generally is \$78/hr) of the speech-language pathologist and placement responsibilities for direct and indirect speech therapy and assessment services. ***Average monolingual rate is \$72/hr.***	4 hour minimum per day	\$70-\$78

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

Cobb Pediatric Therapy Services	1	Hour	\$69.00	\$69.00	\$69.00 per hour is our maximum price per hour for Licensed Specialist in School Psychology and Orientation and Mobility services. Our range of pricing is determined by the therapy being provided. Please refer to the therapy type and price per hour given with each service in the Rate Range field below. Speech Language Pathologist - \$68.00/hour; Occupational Therapist - \$67.00/hour; Physical Therapist - \$67.00/hour; Licensed Specialist in School Psychology - \$69.00/hour; Educational Diagnostician - \$66.00/hour; Orientation and Mobility Specialist - \$69.00/hour		Speech Language Pathologist - \$68.00/hour; Occupational Therapist - \$67.00/hour; Physical Therapist - \$67.00/hour; Licensed Specialist in School Psychology - \$69.00/hour; Educational Diagnostician - \$66.00/hour; Orientation and Mobility Specialist - \$69.00/hour
Contract Resource Group	1	Hour	\$40.00	\$40.00		4 Hour minimum. To be determined based on project basis.	\$150.00 min to Negotiated install rate based on project.
Evergreen Speech Therapy, PLLC	1	Hour	\$68.00	\$68.00			in prior contracts have billed between 12 and 19.5 hours per week across 36 weeks for range between \$29,376 and \$47,736
Gulf Coast Therapy Houston	1	Hour	\$65.00	\$65.00	Please see proposal below: English Evaluations: 300.00 PER STUDENT Bilingual Evaluations: 400.00 PER STUDENT Speech Therapy: 65 per hour ARD Attendance: 65 per hour	10-40 HOURS PER WEEK; CAN SERVICE AS NECESSARY.	PLEASE SEE SUPPLIER NOTE
Invo Healthcare Associates	1	Hour	\$85.00	\$85.00	Board Certified Behavior Analyst price per hour \$85.00 Educational Diagnostician price per hour \$67.00. Licensed Specialist School Psychologist price per hour \$67.00. Licensed Vocational Nurse price per hour \$ 44.00. Music Therapist \$50.00 price per hour. Orientation and Mobility Specialist price per hour \$85.00. Occupational Therapist price per hour \$65.00. Physical Therapist price per hour \$69.00. Speech Language Pathologist price per hour \$ 65.00.	N/A	\$44.00-\$85.00

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

Kelley W Hawkins	1	Hour	\$45.00	\$45.00			
Masterword Services, Inc.	1	Hour	\$143.95	\$143.95	This rate is applied to the FIRST hour for ASL services which includes the administrative fee; 57.58 per hour after the first hour; Please refer to Section 3. Pricing Delivery Fee of MasterWord Services's Narrative Proposal. Rates varies based on type of services need (Educational Interpreting Services). In addition, please see "Additional Terms of Services" for minimums and cancellation notices.	1 Hour minimum per ASL interpreter requested; Please refer to Section 3. Pricing Delivery Fee of MasterWord Services's Narrative Proposal. Rates varies based on type of services need (Educational Interpreting Services). In addition, please see "Additional Terms of Services" for minimums and cancellation notices.	Pricing is valid for the first three (3) years; a maximum of 3% increase may be applied to reflect the cost of providing services thereafter.
Mediscan Staffing Services	1	Hour	\$85.00	\$85.00		0	SLP: \$70-\$75; SLPA: \$60-\$65; OT: \$70-\$75; COTA: \$60-\$65; PT: \$70-\$75; PTA: \$60-\$65; LSSP: \$80-\$85; Educational Diagnostician: \$75-\$80; BCBA: \$60-\$65; TVI: \$65-\$70; RN: \$55-\$60; LVN: \$45-\$50; Special Education Teacher: \$55-\$60; Sign Language Interpreter: \$73-\$78
MedPerm Placement Inc., dba Therapy Consultants	1	Hour	\$72.00	\$72.00	This is the maximum rate we would ever charge for a specific professional service. Please see the Attribute "Rate Range" for direction to our Rates attached in the response attachments. Thank you very much.		Please see Response Attachment titled "TCI Rates". Thank you.
Pinwheel Therapy	1	Hour	\$68.00	\$68.00	Please see attached proposal for hourly rates for bilingual staffing as well.		

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

Providential Counseling & Consulting Services, PLLC	1	Hour	\$80.00	\$80.00		4.0	
RiverKids Pediatric Home Health	1	Hour	\$85.00	\$85.00			Our typical discounted range for PISD is ~\$85-120 per hour/visit depending on whether it is a treatment session or and evaluation.
Rohrer Resources	1	Hour	\$95.00	\$95.00	The hourly rate pertains to services that are billed per hour such as classroom consultations, evaluations for In-home/Parent Training, and ARD meeting preparation.	Only for In-home/P	
Social Thinking (Think Social Publishing, Inc.)	1	Hour	\$250.00	\$250.00			
Soliant Health	1	Hour	\$43.00	\$43.00	Please see 'Soliant - PISD Attachment' for a complete price list.	None	Please see pricing in attachment
Specialized Assessment & Consulting, LLC	1	Hour	\$125.00	\$125.00	See our Professional Services Agreement for list of all services offered including flat rate assessments, part-time services and full-time services.	Lowest rates are for full-time services for 7.5 hours per day, 5 days per week.	\$50 to \$125 per hour
Sunbelt Staffing	1	Hour	\$55.00	\$55.00	Please see the attached document for our all-inclusive hourly rates for services.	None	Please see pricing in attachment
The Execu Search Group (Execu Search Holdings)	1	Hour	\$74.50	\$74.50	The Execu Search Group has a well-established and accredited Continuing Education program to both orient and continually support our candidates. We would provide the District with the value-added service of Continuing Education/Professional Development seminar(s) or courses up to five hours for each year we provide contract professionals at a significant level (10 FTE providers).	No minimum number of hours	Pricing Structure/Rate Schedule Included In Attachments
TherapyTravelers LLC	1	Hour	\$70.00	\$70.00	This rate is for a School Psychologist. Please see response attachments for additional disciplines and rates.		
Ventris Learning LLC	1	Hour	\$100.00	\$100.00	for conference call/web/skype remote support		
Wingard Therapy Associates	1	Hour	\$65.00	\$65.00	65 SLP/68 Bilingual SLP53 SLPA/55 Bilingual SLPAOT 65PT 65School Psych 65		

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

<p>2 If you are to be paid PER DAY, please give your DAILY RATE. If your services are not billed per day please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on the "Response Attachments" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Day. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per day please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</p>						Rate Range
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
Ardor Health Solutions (All Source Recruiting Group, Inc.)	1	Day	\$480.00	\$480.00	Payment is structured by the hour, with a rate according to the specialty, cost of living, location, rates of similar contracts and the candidates' level of experience. Hourly rates include costs associated with payment of salaries and benefits, and travel expenses of all contracted employees at no additional charge to the district. Hourly rates also include all services such as treatment, evaluation, consultations, meetings and documentation. As a district partner, you will enjoy all our staffing services at NO CHARGE to the district. Our healthcare professionals will provide direct services to the students based on the ARD/IEP, planning, consultation, training, assessment, and evaluations. They will also attend parent conferences, participate in meetings, complete the required paperwork, and follow all procedures outlined by the Special Education Department. We provide our school districts with affordable rates for highly qualified professionals who are available from a full year to a short-term coverage. If there are temporary maternity leaves, FMLA, vacation coverages, or resignations, we have you covered. If you have immediate needs, we should be your first call. Most of our candidates are interested in entertaining full-time positions from 30 to 40 hours per week. The maximum contract hours worked by our contracted employees are 40 hours per week. No time over 40 hours per week will be billed without prior approval from the Director of Special Education and Supervisor. Mileage Rate reimbursement on the same day only between school sites and to the student's home if applicable by the District.	
CARE, LLC (COLLABORATIVE AUTISM RESOURCES & EDUCATION (CARE), LLC)	1	Day	\$1,850.00	\$1,850.00	Inclusive of all expenses (travel, per diem,). Consulting and staff development activities are provided to the district on a daily basis by highly skilled consultants who have extensive school- based experienced with advanced training in areas they are providing support and consultative services on. There a few evaluation trainings such as ADOS-2, ADI-R offered at a higher daily rate due to high demand for district we Consult to these are offered at 2000.00 per day.	
Clinical Communications, LP	1	Day	\$950.00	\$950.00	Daily rate (estimated 6 hours) for: (1) consulting services to include but not limited to special services program review, assessment of processes such as providing advice, opinions, & offering alternative ideas and recommendations.	\$725.00-\$950.00 based on scope of work

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

EDUPROJECT ELL, LLC	1	Day	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00		\$3,000 per day plus expenses not to exceed \$500
Estrellita	1	Day	\$3,200.00	\$3,200.00		\$2200 per training day plus estimated travel expenses of \$1000. If district purchases multiple travel days, \$250 is added for each additional day
Expanding Expression LLC (Sara Smith)	1	Day	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00		https://www.expandingexpression.com/training.php see link for current rates and options, 6000+ depending on materials and travel
Kids Vocabulary	1	Day	\$600.00	\$600.00	Pay TSHA CEU fee unless school district has previous arrangements with TSHA	
Kristin Streich	1	Day	\$900.00	\$900.00		\$500/half day to \$900 full day
LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS (Lakeshore Equipment Company)	1	Day	\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00	Professional Development Workshop, Training, Environment Walk-thru, and Product Demonstration (full-day, up to 8 hours): \$3,500 Professional Development Workshop, Training, Environment Walk-thru, and Product Demonstration (half-day, up to 4 hours): \$2,500	Half-Day (up to 4 hours): \$2,500 \ Full-Day (up to 8 hours): \$3,500
Learning Without Tears (No Tears Learning Inc)	1	Day	\$3,200.00	\$3,200.00		Price is dependent on product purchase amount
Providential Counseling & Consulting Services, PLLC	1	Day	\$600.00	\$600.00		
Rohrer Resources	1	Day	\$800.00	\$800.00	This daily rate pertains to Professional Development workshops and other daily work as agreed to between the school district and the vendor.	

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

Shiloh Treatment Center (Shiloh Treatment Center, Inc.)	1	Day	\$245.00	\$245.00	Daily rates fluctuate based on ARD'd services. Contract addendum's are provided when these changes occur.	Day Services 245.00 to 350.00 per day and Residential Services 350.00 to 500.00 per day this is dependent on ARD'd services.
Social Thinking (Think Social Publishing, Inc.)	1	Day	\$5,500.00	\$5,500.00		
The Master Teacher	1	Day	\$3,800.00	\$3,800.00	Onsite training billed per day. Includes travel.	
Ventris Learning LLC	1	Day	\$2,200.00	\$2,200.00	2200 per day and 1500 per half day onsite services not including anticipated travel expenses or product costs	

3	<p>If you are to be paid PER PARTICIPANT, please give your RATE PER PARTICIPANT. If your services are not billed per participant please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Response Attachments" tab.(Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Participant. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per participant please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</p>					Rate Range	
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
	A.I.R. Project	1	Per Person	\$125.00	\$125.00		
	Avondale House	1	Per Person	\$47,400.00	\$47,400.00		47,400.00 - 71,400.00
	Expanding Expression LLC (Sara Smith)	1	Per Person	\$290.00	\$290.00		Refer to link above that has current pricing options. 1 option is for the full day training without materials. Option 2 is per participant and includes their materials with the training.
Gary & Lana Life Saving Skills	1	Per Person	\$100.00	\$100.00	The per person rate depend upon the class scheduled. The rate will be determined ahead of time. A pricing sheet of current classes with their prices are attached in the response attachments.		

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

Harris County Department of Education	1	Per Person	\$20,605.00	\$20,605.00		Refer to pricing structure under "Response Attachments; 2019-2020 \$20,605 per seat in-county annually; \$3,045 per seat in-county monthly; these prices reflect the 2019-2020 school year and are subject to annual renewal increases, when applicable.
The University of Texas Health Science Center at Houston	1	Per Person	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00		A minimum of 60 sessions per student at 20.00 per session equals 1,200.00 per student served at each campus.

4	<p>If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please give your PER EVENT RATE (Examples of this type of service may include, but not be limited to: speaker at In-service trainings, professional development events, session, etc.). If your services are not billed per Event please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Response Attachments" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Event. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per event please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a</p>					
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes
A.I.R. Project	1	Event	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	Price range is \$1,500 to \$2,500. Price is dependent on the type of request.	Please specify here the range of pricing: \$1,500-\$2,500

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03

Line Response Detail

Abilities Therapy and Consulting, LLC	1	Event	\$550.00	\$550.00		Our assessments are billed at a flat rate ranging from \$325-\$550 depending on the assessment service selected. Complete Price Proposal Uploaded under the Response Attachments Tab.
CARE, LLC (COLLABORATIVE AUTISM RESOURCES & EDUCATION (CARE), LLC)	1	Event	\$1,850.00	\$1,850.00	1850 per day for staff development trainings on a variety of topics, 2000 per day for ADOS-2 f ADI-R evaluation trainings for assessment personnel	
Clinical Communications, LP	1	Event	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	One day meeting(s) and presentation to administration and staff regarding integrating telepractice into special education.	Price may vary based on scope of work if one day meeting beomes a consulting project (see #2 above)
Expanding Expression LLC (Sara Smith)	1	Event	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00		for current pricing, see https://www.expandingexpression.com/training.php , 6000+ depending on materials and travel
Julia Strait	1	Event	\$1,600.00	\$1,600.00		600-800 half day and 1200-1600 full day workshop, depending on details
Kids Vocabulary	1	Event	\$600.00	\$600.00		
Providential Counseling & Consulting Services, PLLC	1	Event	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00		\$1800-\$5000
Rohrer Resources	1	Event	\$800.00	\$800.00	This rate applies to a one-day event only. Multiple days would be at the daily event rate per day.	

Special Programs Contracted Services RFP #19-0411-03
Line Response Detail

Valley Speech Language and Learning Center	1	Event	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00		Please see attached compensation schedule for programs, prices, duration, necessary materials and targeted audience.
--	---	-------	------------	------------	--	--

Line Response Detail

<p>5 If you are to be paid LUMP SUM, please give your rate. If your services are not billed per LUMP SUM please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Line Items" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Lump Sum. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per lump sum please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</p>						Rate Range
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
Expanding Expression LLC (Sara Smith)	1	Lump Sum	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00		for current pricing, see https://www.expandingexpression.com/training.php for pricing options, 6000+ depending on materials and travel

<p>6 If you are to be paid PER SITE (LOCATION), please give your rate. If your services are not billed PER SITE please click on "NO BID" Vendors must submit a price proposal on "Line Items" tab. (Note: This is the maximum rate that Pearland ISD will pay for your services. Vendor may provide a range of price Per Location. Quotes may be requested at the time services are needed). If your services are not billed per site please click on "NO BID". Failure to submit a price structure or respond to at least one of the proposed price structures under the "Line Items" tab shall constitute a non-responsive bid. Alternatively vendors may attach a pricing structure price list on "Response Attachments" tab, if needed.</p>						Rate Range
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Rate	Extended	Supplier Notes	Please specify here the range of pricing:
A.I.R. Project	1	Per Site	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00		\$10,000-\$15,000